Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steven Tan <almightyautomotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 December 2022 11:17 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team
Subject: Re: PA8539R After repair photos

Hi Veron,

We are ok with the repair cost.

Regards
Steven Tan

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 7, 2022 12:08 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>;
almightyautomotive@hotmail.com <almightyautomotive@hotmail.com>

Subject: RE: PA8539R After repair photos

Dear Steven,

As spoken, there is some calculation error.

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $5,850 /- with 06 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Kindly Acknowledge.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 December 2022 5:00 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: PA8539R After repair photos



From: Steven Tan <almightyautomotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 December 2022 4:59:40 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: PA8539R After repair photos

Hi Rasul,

We are ok with the amount,

Regards
Steven Tan

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 6, 2022 12:02 PM

To: Steven Tan <almightyautomotive@hotmail.com>
Subject: Re: PA8539R After repair photos

Hi Steven,
Audit checked part prices required to be audited.

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $6,900.00 /- with 06 days of
repair, subject to their approval.

Kindly Acknowledge.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 November 2022 11:14 am

To: Steven Tan <almightyautomotive @hotmail.com>
Subject: Re: PA8539R After repair photos

Hi Steven,

noted will reply you asap

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

[x] Save the Earth- FPrint only when necessary:

From: Steven Tan <almightyautomotive@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 28 October 2022 8:50 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: PA8539R After repair photos

Hi Rasul,

Could we finalise on the PA8539R?

Regards
Steven Tan

From: Steven Tan <almightyautomotive@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, October 7, 2022 2:43 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: PA8539R After repair photos

Hi Rasul,

As per attached.

Regards
Steven Tan

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, October 7, 2022 2:39 PM

To: Steven Tan <almightyautomotive @hotmail.com>
Subject: Re: PA8539R After repair photos

i mean resurvey damage photos

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth: Frint only wher necessary




From: Steven Tan <almightyautomotive@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 7 October 2022 2:39 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: PA8539R After repair photos

From: Steven Tan

Sent: Monday, September 19, 2022 7:29 PM
To: rasul@lkkauto.com <rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: PA8539R After repair photos

Hi Rasul,

As per attached is the add on quotation and the photos of after-repair.

Kindly let us know the finalisation amount. Thanks.

Regards
Steven Tan
9668 9668



