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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: TEAMWORKGARAGE <claims@teamworkgarage.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 2 May 2023 6:23 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: TEAMWORK
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER 
Attachments: SKM_C300i23050217510.pdf

Dear Hsiao tong , 
 
Attached . 
 
Do let us have the payment soonest . 
 

Account Name   Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Account Number   378-303-292-7 
Bank Name   United Overseas Bank 
Bank & Branch Code   7375 / 448 

 
 
 
Thank you and have a nice day!  সহ঺঻ 
 
Letitia 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore (408934) 
Tel: 6844 2475|Fax: 6844 2474 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Friday, 28 April 2023 8:23 am 
To: claims@teamworkgarage.com 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
 
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm,  
  
Thank you for your acceptance.  
  
We confirm settlement at $4,974.00(all-in).  
  
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
  
Please let us have your company bank details for payment processing. 
  

Account Name    
Account Number    
Bank Name    
Bank & Branch Code    
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: claims@teamworkgarage.com <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, March 29, 2023 10:06 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear sir , 
 
We refer to the offer below , it is acceptable 
 
Please let us have the DV. 
 
Thank you and have a nice day. 
 

Keith Lian 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 
#01-24 
Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore 408934 
Tel: 6844 2475  
Fax:6844 2474 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 28 March 2023 8:53 pm 
To: TEAMWORKGARAGE <claims@teamworkgarage.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We propose settlement as follows: -  
   

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $ 4,374.00 
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $120.00)  $    600.00 

Total  $ 4,974.00 
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Please confirm acceptance.  
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: - 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
From: TEAMWORKGARAGE <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 
Sent: Monday, 20 February 2023 4:14 pm 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
dear Sir , 
  
We confirm COR @ $4050 4 days . 
  
Attached is the letter of demand , do let us have the offer soonest . 
  
Thank you and have a nice day!  সহ঺঻ 
  
Letitia 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore (408934) 
Tel: 6844 2475|Fax: 6844 2474 
  

From: Darren Ng 
Sent: Wednesday, 8 February 2023 1:32 pm 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Taufikh, 
  
Kindly revise and get back to us on the amount. 
  
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
  

From: Darren Ng 
Sent: Tuesday, 31 January 2023 1:05 pm 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Taufikh, 
  
Please refer to email below, kindly revise and get back to us. 
  
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
  

From: Darren Ng 
Sent: Thursday, 19 January 2023 12:22 pm 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Taufikh, 
  
My boss is asking whether can close at $4400? 
  
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
  

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Wednesday, 18 January 2023 10:41 am 
To: Darren Ng 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
Hi Darren, 
  
Please refer revised attached, COR l/s $4050 , 4 days. 
  
Subject to insurance approval. 
  
Regards 
Taufikh 
Lkk Auto 
  

From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 4 January 2023 3:54 pm 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Dear Taufikh, 
  
Any update? 
  
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
  

From: Darren Ng 
Sent: Tuesday, 20 December 2022 9:13 am 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Taufikh, 
  
Any update on the parts price 
  
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
  

From: Darren Ng 
Sent: Friday, 16 December 2022 10:16 am 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Taufikh, 
  
Any update? 
  
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
  

From: Darren Ng 
Sent: Wednesday, 14 December 2022 9:23 am 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Dear Taufikh, 
  
Please go through and let us have the revised amount soonest. 
  
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
  

From: Darren Ng 
Sent: Friday, 9 December 2022 9:49 am 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Taufikh & Hsiao Tong, 
  
I would like to counter-propose for below items. 
  
Front Door Panel LH - $2001 
Front Step Garnish LH - $622 
Front Grille - $1178 
  
Kindly revise and get back to us. 
  
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
  

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Monday, 28 November 2022 11:38 am 
To: Darren Ng 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
Hi Darren, 
  
Please refer attached, COR l/s $3500 , 4 days. 
  
Subject to insurance approval. 
  
Regards 
Taufikh 
Lkk Auto 
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From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 30 August 2022 4:38 pm 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: YP2182P MITSUBISHI CANTER  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Taufikh, 
  
FYNA 
  
Based on estimate calculation: 
  
COR @ $4800 
DOR @ 4 Days 
  
Kindly revise and get back to us on the finalize amount. 
  
Regards 
Darren 
68442475 
BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK 
UBI AVE 1 #01-24 
S(408934) 
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
  
 


