Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 August 2022 3:13 PM
To: geraldpoh@lonpac.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; SUR

Subject: RE: MARKET VAULE OF GBJ 2361T

Dear Gerald,

The MV of GBJ 2361T is $ 45K-48K (est) as at Nov 2021

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 1:24 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: MARKET VAULE OF SMD1450C

Dear Gerald,

Attachment different vehicle number.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 1:21 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: MARKET VAULE OF SMD1450C

FYNA. Thanks.



Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 12:42 PM

To: Chow CP <chowauto@singnet.com.sg>; 'assignments' <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: MARKET VAULE OF SMD1450C

Lonpac External - General

Dear all,

Please advise market value as at 30/11/2021 based attached LTA Rebate.

Thank you
Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



