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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 18 November 2022 3:38 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team
Subject: FW: FINALIZE SLP5691X DOA: 17.07.2022

  

From: Ai Nee (Motorway) Tew <ainee@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Sent: Friday, 18 November 2022 3:37:29 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; Lion City Rentals ARC <lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: FINALIZE SLP5691X DOA: 17.07.2022 

Dear Rasul,  
 
We confirm the COR.  
 
Thanks & Regards  
6571 9642 
Ainee 
 
 
On Fri, Nov 18, 2022 at 1:58 PM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
Hi Ainee,  
  
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $1,350.00 /- with 3 days of repair, 

subject to their approval. 
 
Kinsly acknowledge 
 
 
Best Regards,  
Rasul | Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Ai Nee (Motorway) Tew <ainee@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 17 November 2022 1:48 pm 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Lion City Rentals ARC <lcrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg> 
Subject: FINALIZE SLP5691X DOA: 17.07.2022  
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Dear Rasul,  
 
can we finalize, please find attach after repair photo.  
 
 
Thanks & Regards  
6571 9642 
Ainee 


