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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 22 August 2022 3:40 PM
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments
Cc: Teo Jie Yang; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim
Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10017031/JY || OI- SMQ4295X (White) TP- SLL5127E || Est: 

$18,630.24 || Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd
Attachments: C10017031.zip

Hi Team 
 
We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SLL5127E (Vehicle Not In) 
 
Workshop name 
176 Sin Ming Drive, #03-09/10, Singapore 575721 
 
Contact: Venus Lee (+65 9792 1329) 
 
Please find attached GIA reports for your reference. 
 
Best regards, 
 
Salizawati Haizar 
Admin Executive, Claims 
 
F +65 6725 0853   
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 

From: venus <venus@ltm.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 22 August 2022 11:23 am 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; admin@ltm.sg 
Cc: Teo Jie Yang <jieyang.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'Mandy Lim' <Mandy@ltm.sg> 
Subject: RE: PRI Request on 19.08.2022 || Our ref: C10017031/JY || Survey Request SLL5127E & SMQ4292X D.O.A : 
18/08/2022 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Salizawati Haizar, 
 
Our client select LKK.   
 
Thank you and regards, 
 

Venus Lee 
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Accident Claims Department 
 
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 
www. LTM.sg 
+65 6452 0893 (Office) 
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 
+65 9792 1329 (Mobile) 
 

Like us in Facebook!! 
www.facebook.com/LTMsg 
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
 

 
 

From: admin@ltm.sg <admin@ltm.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 19 August 2022 5:27 pm 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Cc: 'Mandy Lim' <Mandy@ltm.sg>; 'venus' <venus@ltm.sg> 
Subject: RE: Survey Request - Our Client : SLL 5127 E Your Driver : SMQ 4292 X D.O.A : 18/08/2022 
 
 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Good Afternoon Sir / Madam, 
  
We are assisting our mutual client the vehicle owner of SLL 5127 E to submit a claim against your driver, SMQ 4292 X 
which we understand that you are the company at the material time of the accident. 
  
We now enclosed the following documents for your easy reference :  
  

       Our client’s GIA report 
         Repair Estimate 
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Please let us have a list of your external surveyor for us to choose. Our client’s vehicle is not in the garage. 
 
Please let us have your clearance of liability for direct settlement. 
 
 
 
Regards, 
 
Quek Zixiang 
 
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd 
 
www. LTM.sg 
+65 6452 0893 (Office) 
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile) 
 

Like us in Facebook!! 
www.facebook.com/LTMsg 
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore 
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