Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Subject:
PROPERTY CLAIM
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO : ANY PERSONAL INJURY
CLAIMS

Dear Sir/Madam,

Soon Hoo Loo <soonhoo®@lioncityrentals.com.sg>

Tuesday, 21 March 2023 6:50 PM

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Ai Nee (Motorway) Tew; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); Lion City
Rentals ARC; SUR

Re: FINALIZE SLB3779P DOA: 20 Aug 2022 *** LKK REF: CS/SM022008036/Avy3

We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable to your proposed repair cost of $2,100.00 (before GST) at 4
working days for vehicle number SLB3779P.

Thank you.

Regards,
Loo Soon Hoo

Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd

On Thu, Mar 16, 2023 at 4:46 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ai Nee,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $2,100 with 4 days of repair, subject to their

approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 17 November 2022 1:46 PM

To: Ai Nee (Motorway) Tew <ainee@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Lion City Rentals ARC <Icrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALIZE SLB3779P DOA: 20 Aug 2022 *** LKK REF: CS/SM022008036/Avy3

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective surveyor will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi Adrian,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Ai Nee (Motorway) Tew <ainee@lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 17 November 2022 12:56 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Lion City Rentals ARC <Icrarc@lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Subject: FINALIZE SLB3779P DOA: 20 Aug 2022

Dear All,

can we finalize, please find attach after repair photo.

Thanks & Regards
6571 9642

Ainee



