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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 9 November 2022 11:39 AM
To: Dennis Leong; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: YOUR REF: SHD6039J OUR REF: SDN1801C THIRD PARTY CLAIM 
Attachments: SDN1801C FINALIZED.pdf; SDN 1801 SUPPL.png

Hi Dennis,  
  
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $5,997.28.00 /- with 04 days of 

repair, subject to their approval. 
 
Aside to Huey Yon, refer to attachment for the supplementary copy 
 

Best Regards,  
Rasul | Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Dennis Leong <dennisleong@motorimage.net> 
Sent: Wednesday, 9 November 2022 11:23 am 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: LKINSTEAM <LKINSTEAM@tanchong.org> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SHD6039J OUR REF: SDN1801C THIRD PARTY CLAIM  
  
Hi Rasul, 
  
As spoken please refer to attachment as amended finalize repair estimate. 
  
COR: $5997.28 before GST. 
  
04 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH). 
  
Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible. 
  
Best Regards. 
  
DENNIS LEONG 
  
Insurance Claim  
Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 
25 Leng Kee Road 
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Singapore 159097 
DID: (65) 6703 8164 
HP: (65) 9489 9000  
Email: dennisleong@motorimage.net 
  
  
From: Dennis Leong  
Sent: Monday, 7 November 2022 3:23 pm 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: LKINSTEAM <LKINSTEAM@tanchong.org> 
Subject: FW: YOUR REF: SHD6039J OUR REF: SDN1801C THIRD PARTY CLAIM  
  
Dear Rasul, 
  
Our COR computation is attached for your agreement.  
  
COR: $6167.48 before GST. 
  
04 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH). 
  
Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible. 
  
Best Regards. 
  
DENNIS LEONG 
  
Insurance Claim  
Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 
25 Leng Kee Road 
Singapore 159097 
DID: (65) 6703 8164 
HP: (65) 9489 9000  
Email: dennisleong@motorimage.net 
  
  
  
From: Magnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Ana.Magnaye@strides.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 23 August 2022 1:55 pm 
To: Jobi Thomas <jobithomas@motorimage.net> 
Cc: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>; Dennis Leong <dennisleong@motorimage.net> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SHD6039J OUR REF: SDN1801C THIRD PARTY CLAIM  
  
Our Ref : TAX/08/22/2048 
  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
  
Dear Jobi, 
  
  
We can do Direct Settlement. 
Quantum to be agreed.  
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Thanks & Best Regards, 
Ana Magnaye 
Ana Magnaye 
Claims Department 
  
Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705 
DID: 6866 2678 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: ana.magnaye@strides.com.sg  | www.stridesmobility.com.sg 
  

 
  

From: Jobi Thomas <jobithomas@motorimage.net>  
Sent: Tuesday, 23 August 2022 12:29 pm 
To: Magnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Ana.Magnaye@strides.com.sg> 
Cc: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>; Dennis Leong <dennisleong@motorimage.net> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SHD6039J OUR REF: SDN1801C THIRD PARTY CLAIM  
  
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and 
are expecting the content or attachment.  

Dear Ana, 
  
Kindly refer to the attached marked estimate, survey done by LKK.  
  
Kindly advice on the liability /status of the claim. 
  
We are waiting for your prompt reply, thanks. 
  
Best Regards. 
  
Jobi Thomas 
  
Insurance Claim Executive 
Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 
25 Leng Kee Road 
Singapore 159097 
DID: (65) 6703 8164 
HP: (65) 9668 9313  
Email: jobithomas@motorimage.net 
  
From: Magnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Ana.Magnaye@strides.com.sg>  
Sent: 23 August, 2022 11:45 AM 
To: Jobi Thomas <jobithomas@motorimage.net> 
Cc: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SHD6039J OUR REF: SDN1801C THIRD PARTY CLAIM  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
  
Dear Jobi, 
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Please let us have the estimate.  
  
  
Thanks & Best Regards, 
Ana Magnaye 
Ana Magnaye 
Claims Department 
  
Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705 
DID: 6866 2678 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: ana.magnaye@strides.com.sg  | www.stridesmobility.com.sg 
  

 
  

From: Jobi Thomas <jobithomas@motorimage.net>  
Sent: Tuesday, 23 August 2022 10:03 am 
To: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg> 
Cc: LKINSTEAM <LKINSTEAM@tanchong.org>; Dennis Leong <dennisleong@motorimage.net>; Magnaye Ana Margie 
Marasigan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Ana.Magnaye@strides.com.sg>; Ong Hua Yen (Strides Automotive 
Services Pte Ltd) <HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SHD6039J OUR REF: SDN1801C THIRD PARTY CLAIM  
  
CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and 
are expecting the content or attachment.  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
  
Kindly advice on the liability /status of the claim. 
  
We are waiting for your prompt reply, thanks. 
  
Best Regards. 
  
Jobi Thomas 
  
Insurance Claim Executive 
Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 
25 Leng Kee Road 
Singapore 159097 
DID: (65) 6703 8164 
HP: (65) 9668 9313  
Email: jobithomas@motorimage.net 
  
From: Jobi Thomas  
Sent: 19 August, 2022 9:09 AM 
To: MTPRI@smrt.com.sg 
Cc: LKINSTEAM <LKINSTEAM@tanchong.org>; Dennis Leong <dennisleong@motorimage.net> 
Subject: YOUR REF: SHD6039J OUR REF: SDN1801C THIRD PARTY CLAIM  
  
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
  
Kindly refer to the attached documents and arrange survey for our client’s vehicle ASAP, thanks. 
  
Best Regards. 
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Jobi Thomas 
  
Insurance Claim Executive 
Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 
25 Leng Kee Road 
Singapore 159097 
DID: (65) 6703 8164 
HP: (65) 9668 9313  
Email: jobithomas@motorimage.net 
  
 

 
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or use 
any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the sender 
immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The sender does not 
accept liability for any errors or omissions.  


