Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 August 2022 1:16 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Cc: Jason Tea Chee Kiat

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10017038/JT || Ol- SMN9942U (Silver) TP- PC4921K || Est:
$7,629.79.00 || Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Attachments: C10017038.zip

Hi Team

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: PC4921K

Mova Automotive
1008 Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-04/06/08, Singapore 159722

Contact: Nitha (6272 3892)
Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.

Ol have yet to make reporting.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 August 2022 12:31 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <jason.tea@budgetdirect.com.sg>; keong@mova.com.sg; 'Enny' <enny@mova.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PRI Request on 18.08.2022 | | Our ref: C10017038/JT || TP CLAIMS - PC4921K AGAINST SMN9942U DOA
16/08/2022

Dear All,
Kindly assign LKK.

Thank you,
Best Regards,



Nuthha
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltd

From: Nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 6:51 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: keong@mova.com.sg; 'Enny' <enny@mova.com.sg>

Subject: TP CLAIMS - PC4921K AGAINST SMN9942U DOA 16/08/2022

Dear All,
Kindly assign surveyor and advise on the liability.

Thank you
Best Regards,

N vHroo
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltd



