Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 3:27 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Cc: Jared Liu Yaorong

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10017026/JL || Ol- SLJ3486S (GOLD) TP- SMM8855A || Est:
$5,568.40 || Hup Motor Trading & Service

Attachments: C10017026.zip

Hi Team

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SMM8855A

Hup Motor Trading & Service
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93
#01-120

Singapore 528838

Contact: David Ang (9815 4655)
Please find attached GIA report for your reference.
Ol has yet to make reporting.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose | Platinum
; Trusted

Budget
Direct
msurance 2022 _ jgefo’f

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 11:45 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 17/08/22, INVOLVING CLIENT'S VEHICLE : SMM 8855 A & YOUR INSURED : SLJ 3486 S,
ALONG ANG MO KIO AVE | TOWARD MARYMOUNT RD

Dear Sirs,

Attach our estimate bill, GIA third party insurer search fee, client's GIA report, insurance certificate & log
card for your reference & attention,



Kindly assign your panel surveyor (LKK Auto Consultants Pte. Ltd, One of our insurer panel also) to survey
the client's damaged vehicle On : 19/08/22 (at 2pm to 2.30pm) as owner waiting, PLease revert &
confirm the survey appointments.

Kindly revert the client's third party claims liability, reference & OIC, As we are looking for direct
settlement.

Best Regards
David Ang

Tel : 6784 0039, Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655
Mailing Address :

Hup Motor Trading & Service

Blk 9004 Tampines St 93

#01-120

Singapore 528838



