Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: claim@abengineering.sg

Sent: Monday, 12 September 2022 4:16 PM
To: SUR; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBK 4930H-DOA: 15/8/2022

Dear Veron Chen,

We agree and accept your offer a cost of repair of LS $1250/- with 3 days of repair.

Thanks & Best Regards,
San Mya Aye

Tel : 8858 6282

AB Engineering Pte Ltd

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 12 September 2022 3:27 pm

To: sanmyaaye@abwinleasing.sg; claims@abwinleasing.sg; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: GBK 4930H-DOA: 15/8/2022

Dear Sir/Madam,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $1250/- with 3 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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