Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 January 2023 11:57 AM

To: Boo seng yak

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SMW6795A - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 18 AUG 22

Attachments: PA07102022 - SMW 6795 A - AUDI Q3 1.4 TFSI S-TRONIC - FRONT - CHINA (TP) + SUPP.xlIsx; 6795 marking.pdf
Hi Johnny,

COR $38,125.60, 11 days.
Subject to insurance approval.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 December 2022 10:40 am

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Carrine Leong
<carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: FINAL REVISION - SMW6795A - TP CHINA - SURVEYED 18 AUG 22

Hi Taufikh and all,

Revised estimate, re-survey docs, photographs attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $38,125.60 @ 11 days exclude 2 Sundays.

Your early closure is appreciated.

Best regards - Johnny Boo



