Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 February 2023 2:43 PM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; Shashi PTCBC
Subject: RE: SNC4786H FINAL BILL

Dear Shashi,
Without prejudice
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of $2,971.10 with 4 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2022 9:53 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SNC4786H FINAL BILL

From: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 October 2022 9:52:40 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SNC4786H FINAL BILL

For your perusal

Thanks
shashi

From: b051776 <shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 August 2022 9:19 am

To: Shashitharan PTCBC <Shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Subject: SNC4786H FINAL BILL

Sent by: [shashitharan@borneomotors.com.sg]
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