
10/25/22, 12:06 PM Re: Invoice of Vehicle SHC 2528X Ref: MT/1184709-002 - Renee Sia (LKK Auto) - Outlook

about:blank 1/1

Re: Invoice of Vehicle SHC 2528X Ref: MT/1184709-002

Tue 10/25/2022 12:05 PM

Dear Yoyo,


Enclose invoice for SHC 2528X.

Thank you.

Best Regards, 
Renee | Reports 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111   Email: report@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933 

From: Renee Sia (LKK Auto) <reneesia@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2022 12:03 PM

To: Yo Yo Tian Tian <YoYoTian.Tian@income.com.sg>; ODsupport <ODsupport@income.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>; QA (LKKAuto) <QA@lkkauto.com>;
Report <report@lkkauto.com>; Quek Swee Keng <SweeKeng.Quek@income.com.sg>; Swee Peng (LKKAuto)
<ongsp@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Invoice of Vehicle SHC 2528X Ref: MT/1184709-002
 
Dear Yoyo,


Enclose invoice for SHC 2528X.

Thank you.

Best Regards, 
Renee | Reports 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111   Email: report@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933 

From: Yo Yo Tian Tian <YoYoTian.Tian@income.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, October 25, 2022 11:43 AM

To: Swee Peng (LKKAuto) <ongsp@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>; QA (LKKAuto) <QA@lkkauto.com>;
Report <report@lkkauto.com>; Quek Swee Keng <SweeKeng.Quek@income.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SHC 2528X Ref: MT/1184709-002

RS Renee Sia (LKK Auto)     
To: Yo Yo Tian Tian <YoYoTian.Tian@income.com.sg> +1 other
Cc: SUR; Accounts (LKK Auto); QA (LKKAuto); Report +2 others
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