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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Nur Hidayah <hidayah@erzatleemotor.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 29 March 2023 3:54 PM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR
Subject: Re: TP CLAIM : FBL 8873H | DOA 19/07/2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We agree and accept the amount given.  
 
Thank You 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Nur Hidayah 
Administrative Executive 
 
Erzat Lee Motor Trading Pte Ltd 
Synergy@KB 23  
Kaki Bukit Road 4 
#01-19 Level 2 Singapore 417801 
E: Hidayah@erzatleemotor.com 
 
 
[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it 
and notify us immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any 
other person. Thank you] 
 
 
On Wed, 29 Mar 2023 at 15:08, Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Hidayah, 

  

"Without Prejudice" 

  

Attached marked estimate for vehicle FBL 8873H. 

  

We recommend cost of repair of Lump Sum $900.00 with 2 days of repair, subject to our Principal approval. 
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Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Nur Hidayah <hidayah@erzatleemotor.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 28, 2023 2:09 PM 
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: TP CLAIM : FBL 8873H | DOA 19/07/2022 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

I have attached to you the post repair pictures for your reference. 

  

Thank You 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Nur Hidayah 

Administrative Executive 

  

Erzat Lee Motor Trading Pte Ltd 

Synergy@KB 23  

Kaki Bukit Road 4 

#01-19 Level 2 Singapore 417801 

E: Hidayah@erzatleemotor.com 
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[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete 
it and notify us immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any 
other person. Thank you] 

  

  

On Fri, 24 Mar 2023 at 10:03, Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Hidayah, 

  

Please provide after repair photographs for above-mentioned vehicle.  

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


