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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 1 March 2023 3:57 PM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: SMZ 4623 k

Ok close 
 
On Wed, 1 Mar 2023 at 3:28 PM, Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir, 

  

We have reviewed the file. 

  

We maintain our offer at Lump Sum $6,500.00 with 3 days of repair, subject to our Principal approval. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 24 February 2023 2:26 PM 
To: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: SMZ 4623 k 

  

Hi, 

Can we close this case at Lump Sum $6,500.00 with 3 days of repair, subject to our Principal approval. 

  

Best Regards, 
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Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 23 February 2023 9:32 PM 
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SMZ 4623 k 

  

Hi Celine 

  

Can we close at $6900 lump sum  

  

Thanks regards  

  

On Wed, 22 Feb 2023 at 7:05 PM, Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

“Without Prejudice” 

Attached marked estimate for vehicle SMZ 4623K. 

We recommend cost of repair of Lump Sum $6,250.00 with 3 days of repair, subject to our Principal approval. 

  

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 31 January 2023 7:09 AM 
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; tslautogarage@gmail.com 
Subject: FW: SMZ 4623 k 

  

Dear Sir, 

  

Refer to your email is SMZ 4263K 

  

  

  

Dear Celine, 

  

FYNA---CS/CTI22007817/Tcy3 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Tsl Auto <tslautogarage@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 30 January 2023 8:26 PM 
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To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SMZ 4623 k 

  

Hi veron 

  

This is SMZ 4623k survey assignment  

  

Please helping to check again  

  

Thanks regards  

  

  


