
1

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 December 2022 5:09 PM

To: ckchen@hongseh.com.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Finalization request for GBL8926P DOA @ 07/08/2022

Dear CK, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Confirm final fig $15,485.84 before excess $750.00 & GST and 14 repair days. 

 

Kindly send the relevant documents to UOI insurance company. 

 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 5:35 PM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Chen Chee Kiong <ckchen@hongseh.com.sg> 

Subject: Finalization request for GBL8926P DOA @ 07/08/2022 

 

Hi Shiau Chan, 

 

I`ve checked the finalize. Kindly assist. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks. 

 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Chen Chee Kiong <ckchen@hongseh.com.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 25 November 2022 5:11 pm 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Finalization request for GBL8926P DOA @ 07/08/2022  

  

Hi steve , 

  

Kindly refer to the attachment .  

  

Best Regards, 

Ck Chen  

Body & Paint Workshop Supervisor 

  

 
Hong Seh Motors Pte LtdHong Seh Motors Pte LtdHong Seh Motors Pte LtdHong Seh Motors Pte Ltd 

10 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629707 

HP: +65 9653 6619 

Email: ckchen@hongseh.com.sg 

  

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 25 November, 2022 11:06 AM 

To: Chen Chee Kiong <ckchen@hongseh.com.sg> 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Finalization request for GBL8926P DOA @ 07/08/2022 

  

Hi CK, 

  

As we communicate earlier. Request damaged photo item 2, 5 and 8. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

Thanks. 

  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Chen Chee Kiong <ckchen@hongseh.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 24 November 2022 4:48 pm 
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To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Finalization request for GBL8926P DOA @ 07/08/2022  

  

Dear Steve, 

  

Kindly refer to the attachment as finalization request .Which is total amount $ 15485.84 (before excess and GST)  

  

Best Regards, 

Ck Chen  

Body & Paint Workshop Supervisor 

  

 
HongHongHongHong    Seh Motors Pte LtdSeh Motors Pte LtdSeh Motors Pte LtdSeh Motors Pte Ltd 

10 Fourth Lok Yang Road Singapore 629707 

HP: +65 9653 6619 

Email: ckchen@hongseh.com.sg 

  


