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RE: SNF9200H / SMS7269S TP CLAIM DOA:06.08.2022

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X3 Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended

recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 August 2022 9:35 am

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SNF9200H / SMS7269S TP CLAIM DOA:06.08.2022

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Motor Claims,
Both party agreed to do private settlement please cancel claim.

Thank you

From: Edwin Abcede Caina

Sent: Friday, 12 August 2022 7:02 pm

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> (claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com)
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Subject: SNF9200H / SMS7269S TP CLAIM DOA:06.08.2022

Motor Claims,

May we check for the liability of accident?

Best Regards,

Edwin Caina
Advisor- Customer Service
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