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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 27 March 2023 11:00 AM
To: rcyc1212@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC9321G (CHINA TAIPING) AND SHC5331B AT/ALONG 

CANTONMENT LINK ON 15/05/2022
Attachments: GIA REPORT SLC9321G.pdf

Our Ref: CC6/CTI23001282/Kpa3 
 
Insured Name : CHAN YEOW CHOY 
Insured Driver : YIO KIAN BENG 
 
Dear Mr Chan Yeow Choy, 
                 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC9321G (CHINA TAIPING) AND SHC5331B AT/ALONG CANTONMENT LINK ON 15/05/2022 
 
We refer to the above subject matter and our earlier tele conversation.  
 
We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance 
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim from SHC5331B against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s favour. 
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

CC3/CTI22007783/Kya3
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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 27 March 2023 11:20 AM
To: Jacqueline Tan; claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: SNM22D203403/C01/SLC9321G/TANCHC / RE: Details of claiment
Attachments: Letter to Insured.pdf

Dear Jacqueline, 
 
We refer to your email below and our previous tele conversation. 
 
I have called OI.  According to him, he was told by his friend that his car was involved in the minor accident.  His friend 
also informed him that third party (the taxi driver) has no intention to claim (no evidence proof).  He insists his friend to 
make an accident report by provided his personal details.  He did not have a copy of accident report lodged by his 
friend. 
 
He is planning to sell his car and fount out from the insurance agent that there will be no reimburse from the remaining 
policy due to accident claim.  He was curious as he did not receive any letter and he has totally forgot about that 
accident.  Explained to him that based on accident report, his friend only provided his h/p number.  All correspondence 
contact including email & mailing address were his friend – the driver.  
 
We also informed OI that based on Singapore Motor Accident Guideline, we will handle & settle third party claim.  OI 
has no dispute on it. 
 
We have emailed OI with a copy of accident report (pls find enclosed).   
 
Thank you. 
 
With warmest regards, 
Ezlyna  
 

From: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 27, 2023 10:33 AM 
To: Roland Chan <rcyc1212@gmail.com> 
Cc: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM22D203403/C01/SLC9321G/TANCHC / RE: Details of claiment 
Importance: High 
 

Message Classification: Confidential 

Dear Mr. Chan, 
 
We refer to your email below. 
 
Please be advised that the third-party vehicle,  SHC5331B,  is filing a third party property claim against your 
motor policy. 
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We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd,  to administer the said claim on our behalf and they will 
contact you for more information about the accident.  Kindly render your assistance and co-operation 
accordingly. 
 
Please contact our claims department at 6389 6185 should you require our assistance or clarification. 
 
Enclosed accident statement for your perusal. 
 
** Note: Password for the attachment would be the combination of your plate number + last 4 characters of NRIC (all 
in CAPITAL) 
 
Dear Ezlyna, 
 
Please assist to give Insured a call. 
 
Regards, 
Jacqueline Tan 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
 
cc. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
      Attn: EzlynaEng 
      Ref: CC3/CTI22007783/Kea3 
      Contact No: 62563561 
      Via email address: ezlyna@lkkauto.com 
 
From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 27, 2023 10:14 AM 
To: Roland Chan <rcyc1212@gmail.com>; Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: O/R: SNM22D203403/C01/SLC9321G/TANCHC / RE: Details of claiment 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
Kindly note case handler is Jacqueline Tan. 
 
Dear Jacqueline, 
 
Fya. 
 
 

Thank you 
Chong Boon Sen 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
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3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175 

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain 
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, 
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and 
any copies of it thereafter. 
 

From: Roland Chan <rcyc1212@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, March 24, 2023 10:44 PM 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: Details of claiment 
 

 

With reference to the 'claim dated on 15-05-2022 , third party vehicle SHC5331B / TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD'.  

Can you provide me the details of this claim as I have not been inform of any such case and also  who is the person that 
make this claiment.  

Thank you.  

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Thursday, 13 April 2023 9:13 am
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE} / YR REF: SNM22D203403/C02/SLC9321G/TANCHC / FW: Direct 

Settlement - Accident Involving SLC9321G (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHC5331B (TP : LKK REF 
- CC3/CTI22007783/Kea3) on 15/05/2022

Hi Asher, 
 
Please proceed to settle as follow: 
COR: 1,524.32 
LOR $ 192.60 
LOI $ 100.00 
Search fee $7.45 
TOTAL $1,824.37 
 
 
Regards, 
Jacqueline Tan 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
 
From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 27, 2023 11:49 AM 
To: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE:[SEEK MANDATE} / YR REF: SNM22D203403/C02/SLC9321G/TANCHC / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident 
Involving SLC9321G (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHC5331B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI22007783/Kea3) on 15/05/2022 
 

 

Your ref: SNM22D203403/C02/SLC9321G/TANCHC 
LKK ref : CC3/CTI22007783/Kea3 
 
Dear Jacqueline, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLC9321G (CHINA TAIPING) AND SHC5331B (TP) ON 15/05/2022 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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It is an accident under BOLA 27, OI rear ended TP. We are of the view that liability is on our driver’s. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd” at $1,842.37 (all-in). 
 
The summary is as follows: - 
 

 Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair  $ 7,795.70 $ 1,542.32 (w/GST) PBP 
2. Loss of Rental (2 days x $96.30) $    192.60 $    192.60 (2 days x $96.30) 
3. Loss of Income (2 days x $50) $    100.00 $    100.00 (2 days x $50) 
4. LTA Search fee $        7.45 $        7.45 
Total $ 8,095.75 $ 1,842.37 

 
 
Surveyor recommended 2 days for repair. 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 12/10/2022 is only for mandate purpose. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
Best Regards, 
Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 

From: Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Thursday, August 18, 2022 6:59 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM22D203403/C02/SLC9321G/TANCHC / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLC9321G (OI : CTI - 
TBA) and SHC5331B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI22007783/Kea3) on 15/05/2022 
 

Hi Asher, 

Enclosed OI SAS for your necessary action. 

Please assist to obtain VF from 3P. 

**The file has been encrypted with a password which will be sent in a separate email. 

NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay 
is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email 
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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Regards, 
Jacqueline Tan 
Senior Executive 
Claims Department 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6185 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
 

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 August 2022 3:30 pm 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Jacqueline Tan <jacqueline.tan@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: O/R: SNM22D203403/C02/SLC9321G/TANCHC / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLC9321G (OI : CTI - 
TBA) and SHC5331B (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI22007783/Kea3) on 15/05/2022 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
Please note that officer in charge for this case is Jacqueline Tan. 
  
Claim no SNM22D203403/C02/SLC9321G/TANCHC. 
  
Dear Jacqueline, 
  
Pls revert LKK. 
 
 
 

NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is 
to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via email 
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Thank you 
 
Chong Boon Sen 
Claims Department 
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909  
DID: (65) 63896116   |   F: (65) 62247175   
   

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may 
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in 
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. 
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 16 August 2022 11:49 AM 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLC9321G (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHC5331B (TP : LKK REF - 
CC3/CTI22007783/Kea3) on 15/05/2022 
 

 

Dear Sir/ Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have inspected TP vehicle SHC 5331B at M/s Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd - Ang Mo Kio on a WP basis and 
TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  

- TP GIA report 
- TP estimated cost of repair 
- Preliminary advice 

 
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 
 
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher. 
 
To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  


	d45b943228c9108558ce4b28c96add80b19b2ae0fd46cfe4768b6262a7fa2488.pdf
	49d902270cf16bb4ca692fa5c9ed0c4aa71edaaa165393c660403b5cfd03aaca.pdf
	49d902270cf16bb4ca692fa5c9ed0c4aa71edaaa165393c660403b5cfd03aaca.pdf
	4d5e6db9cf68dee7158a1b09c2b5e7b88cdca40764c43bc8054523df0bf8e7fc.pdf
	49d902270cf16bb4ca692fa5c9ed0c4aa71edaaa165393c660403b5cfd03aaca.pdf
	49d902270cf16bb4ca692fa5c9ed0c4aa71edaaa165393c660403b5cfd03aaca.pdf
	49d902270cf16bb4ca692fa5c9ed0c4aa71edaaa165393c660403b5cfd03aaca.pdf
	49d902270cf16bb4ca692fa5c9ed0c4aa71edaaa165393c660403b5cfd03aaca.pdf

	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	d45b943228c9108558ce4b28c96add80b19b2ae0fd46cfe4768b6262a7fa2488.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style


