Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 May 2023 2:45 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: REPAIR COST FINALISATION FOR SLK1381T

From: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 May 2023 2:44:55 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: shien@jssmautosolutions.com <shien@jssmautosolutions.com>; sean@jssmautosolutions.com
<sean@jssmautosolutions.com>; adminl@jssmautosolutions.com <adminl@jssmautosolutions.com>
Subject: Re: REPAIR COST FINALISATION FOR SLK1381T

Good day,
Yes we accept the repair cost finalisation. We proceed to do what is necessary on your end.
We will proceed to issue the LOD to the insurers.

Motor Claims Department
AUTO MEGA MALL PTE LTD [HQ]

WORKSHOP ADDRESS:

From: "Huey Yon (LKKAuto)" <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Date: Monday, 22 May 2023 at 11:34 AM

To: "Taufikh (LKKAuto)" <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>, Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg>
Subject: RE: REPAIR COST FINALISATION FOR SLK1381T

Hi Jonathan,
Any updates?

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, May 16, 2023 10:04 PM

To: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg>

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: REPAIR COST FINALISATION FOR SLK1381T



Hi Jonathan,
Please refer attached, COR lumpsum $3900, 4 days.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, September 7, 2022 10:29 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: REPAIR COST FINALISATION FOR SLK1381T

Good Morning Mr TauFik Sir,

With reference to the below email last week 31°" August. This is a follow up email on the repair cost
finalisation needed for the closure of this case directly with your represented insurers.

Motor Claims Department
AUTO MEGA MALL PTE LTD [HQ]

Motorclaims @ammpl.com.sg

WORKSHOP ADDRESS:

From: Lim Jonathan <motorclaims@ammpl.com.sg>
Date: Wednesday, 31 August 2022 at 1:33 AM

To: "Taufikh (LKK Auto)" <taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REPAIR COST FINALISATION FOR SLK1381T

Without Prejudice,
Good day Mr Taufikh esteemed surveyor sir,

Hope my email find you well. Attached is the Cost Estimate for your esteem assessment and
mark down.

Date of Release car back to Client: 18.08.2022

Attached documents:




Cost Estimate.
After Repair Pictures.

Please assist me to finalised as this case Soonest so that we can close the case with your
represented insurers soonest save as to further cost. Thanks!

Motor Claims Department
AUTO MEGA MALL PTE LTD [HQ]

Motorclaims @ammpl.com.sg

WORKSHOP ADDRESS:



