Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 January 2023 4:21 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: RE:GBG2358U FINALISE

From: Michael <michaelng@thinkone.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 27 January 2023 4:21:06 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE:GBG2358U FINALISE

Hi Rasul.
Thank you for your email. We accept the offer

Regards
Michael Ng

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 25 January 2023 10:16 am
To: michaelng@thinkone.com.sg

Subject: Re: RE:GBG2358U FINALISE

Hi Michael,

refer to attachment

Audit checked parts prices need verification.

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $5,800.00./- with 07 days of
repair, subject to their approval.

Kindy acknowledges

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth: Frint only when necessary-

From: michaelng@thinkone.com.sg <michaelng@thinkone.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 30 August 2022 10:20 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE:GBG2358U FINALISE

Dear Rasul.
Please finalise GBG2358U soonest possible | dun waste time | want to close this case ASAP

Thank you
Michael Ng



