Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Gim Chye TAY (SCDF) <TAY_Gim_Chye@scdf.gov.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 11 August 2022 9:57 AM

To: 'Yan (LKK Auto)’; 'Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)'

Cc: 'SUR’; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)'; Elaine (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle YP 8711Z Ref: 2022 - 48
Attachments: Appraisal Report.pdf; LKKReport-YP 8711Z.pdf

Dear Yan and Olivia, earlier the workshop did not provide the estimated cost. Please conduct a paper surveyor based on
their appraisal report attached. Thank you.

Yours sincerely,

Ralf Tay Gim Chye

Accident Claims Officer

Logistics Department

Singapore Civil Defence Force

91 Ubi Avenue 4, Singapore 408827

DID : +65 6848 3614 | Fax : +65 6848 3651
HP : +65 9743 5954
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WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the infended addressee, you must not
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an
offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error."

From: Elaine (LKK Auto) <report@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 27 May 2022 4:58 pm

To: Gim Chye TAY (SCDF) <TAY_Gim_Chye@scdf.gov.sg>

Cc: 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'Huey Yon (LKKAuto)' <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Pre-Repair Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle YP 87117 Ref: 2022 - 48

Dear Ralf,
Enclose Pre-Repair Survey Report of YP 8711Z.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

ELAINE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933







