Yan (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 August 2022 4:57 PM

To: ‘assignments'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June)
Subject: FW: OD SURVEY FOR SLN6003L (DOA : 04/08/2022)
Attachments: S-chmys22081016400.pdf; IC & LIC.jpg; OD LONPAC.pdf

Lonpac External - General

Our Ref: 22/22/22/VP05/026118 ( Ong Li Li ‘s case)
Dear Yan,

FYNA. We shall advise the excess applicable later.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Sharon Chiong (Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 August 2022 4:39 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Cc: 'June Phua (Cheng Hoe)' <junephua@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: OD SURVEY FOR SLN6003L (DOA : 04/08/2022)

Hi,

Estimate, GIA report and driver’s license as per attached.

Kindly assist to arrange for survey soonest as vehicle is currently lying at YISHUN WORKSHOP.
Please advise on the excess applicable.

Thank you.

Rgds
Sharon Chiong



Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email — chmotor@singnet.com.sg




