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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 August 2022 5:14 PM

To: mttan; Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLC 719C REPAIR LIMIT-DOA: 5/8/2022 (ERGO OD)

Dear Mr Tan, 

 

 

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SLC 719C, part by part repair. 

(Excess $600/-). 

 

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 

6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

 

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 

before completion of the repair. 

 

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 
 

Please provides parts invoice upon finalize. 

 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: mttan <mttan@kanfs.net>  

Sent: Monday, 15 August 2022 12:59 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SLC 719C REPAIR LIMIT 

 

Dear Sir 

 

Ok will undertake the repair at $26K (limit) 

 

Kindly advise on Authorization and excess 

 

Thank you 

 

 

 

 

Mr Tan 

KFS 

67479560 
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On Mon, 15 Aug 2022 11:18:02 +0800, Taufikh \(LKK Auto\) wrote 

> Hi Mr Tan, 

>    

> Based on the Market Value available for this model in the market at the moment, we have checked and reviewed 

the repair limit for this car to $26k.  

>    

> Regards 

> Taufikh 

> Lkk Auto 

>    

> 

> From: mttan [mailto:mttan@kanfs.net] 

> Sent: Friday, 12 August 2022 2:40 PM 

> To: Taufikh (LKK Auto) 
> Cc: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' 

> Subject: Re: SLC 719C REPAIR LIMIT 
>   

> Dear All 

> 

> Able to increase another 2-3k $28000-00, cause the dashboard and air bag ecu and number of parts no stock 

> 

> Kindly review  

> 

> Thank you 

> 

> Mr Tan 

> KFS 

> 67479560 

> 

> On Fri, 12 Aug 2022 11:31:48 +0800, Taufikh \(LKK Auto\) wrote 

> > Hi Mr Tan, 

> >   

> > Please take note repair limit for this vehicle is $25K. Please check and revert if your workshop can repair the 

vehicle within the repair limit, as we have to revert back to Ergo Insurance. 

> >   

> > Thank you. 

> >   

> > Regards 

> > Taufikh 

> > Lkk Auto 

> 

> -- 

 

 

-- 


