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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 10 November 2022 12:14 PM
To: 'raymond@bhh.com.sg'
Cc: Admin A; CS A Team
Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBQ3983E & SMA8159P on 08/06/2022 *** LKK REF: 

CC6/AIG22007477/Uga3

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that your client should keep a proper lookout for our insured 
vehicle who turning left ahead of him and not attempt to ride alongside by squeezing into the space between our 
vehicle and the kerb. We are of the view that our insured is not liable. 
 
In view of this, we regret to inform you that we are unable to look into your client’s claim. 
 
Thank you. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 7 October 2022 1:29 PM 
To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving FBQ3983E & SMA8159P on 08/06/2022 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG22007477/Uga3  
 
3rd Reminders 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to our 2st Reminder on 22/09/2022. 
 
Regret to inform we have yet to receive any response from your end. 
 
As requested by our client, appreciate for you to advise your insured liability for direct settlement as soon as 
possible. 
 
 


