Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 7 October 2022 3:52 PM
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SHD6320X
Hi,

Amount confirmed as per your recommendation, thanks.

Thanks & Regards

Yeo Poh Suan

Strides Automotive Services
PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg

STRIDES

AUTOMOTIVE

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 October 2022 10:38 am

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <PohSuan.Yeo@strides.com.sg>
Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SHD6320X

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender and
are expecting the content or attachment.

Hi Poh Suan,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $6,900.00 /- with 08 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor



