Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi Veron,

Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Monday, 12 September 2022 8:17 PM

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Wally Tan TCBC

Final bill and supplementary for SMF8988L

SMF 8988 final and supp.pdf; SMF 8988 main estimate.pdf

I've checked the finalize $7681.70 before gst. 4 days. Kindly assist.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wally Tan PTCBC <wally.tan@borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 12 September 2022 4:03 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Final bill and supplementary for SMF8988L

Hi Steve,

Please find attached final bill of SMF8988L for your kind perusal.

Thank you

Wally



