Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Felicia.tan@mtmperformancegroup.com
Sent: Thursday, 9 February 2023 12:10 PM
To: Finalization

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SJD 9090R- Finalize

Hi All,

We will the accept the offer,please proceed.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Felicia Tan

48 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST
#01-138 ENTERPRISE HUB
SINGAPORE 608586

H/P : 9622 3233

From: Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 12 January 2023 5:16 pm

To: donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SJD 9090R- Finalize

Hi Donavan,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $2050.00 (P/P, before GST), 3 days. Subject to their
approval.



Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Finalization <finalization@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 5, 2023 7:29 PM

To: donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com <donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com>
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SID 9090R- Finalize

Hi Donavan,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $2050.00 (P/P, before GST), 3 days. Subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Finalization <finalization@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, December 31, 2022 12:04 PM

To: donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com <donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com>
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SID 9090R- Finalize

Hi Donavan,

We will be advising our principal for the costs of repairs in $2050.00 (P/P, before GST), 3 days. Subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,
Case Handler



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com <donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com>
Sent: Friday, 30 December 2022 11:22 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SID 9090R-DOA: 28/7/2022

Good day Veron,
Attached files is after repair photos.

Regards,

Donavan leong
HP:97974474
MTM Performance Auto

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 23 December 2022 4:39 pm

To: donavan.leong@mtmperformancegroup.com

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SID 9090R-DOA: 28/7/2022

Dear Donavan,

Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



