Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Lynn Khong <lynn.khong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 August 2022 5:52 PM

To: 'SUR’; ‘assignments’

Subject: RE: SNM22D205247/C02/KHONGLH | ASSIGNMENT - FWD GIA REPORTS - ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SMU4180Y (INSD) & SKW3485M ALONG COLLYER QUAY ON 27/07/2022
08:27

Password: SMU4180Y

From: Lynn Khong

Sent: Monday, 1 August 2022 5:52 pm

To: 'SUR' <sur@Ilkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: SNM22D205247/C02/KHONGLH | ASSIGNMENT - FWD GIA REPORTS - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMU4180Y (INSD)
& SKW3485M ALONG COLLYER QUAY ON 27/07/2022 08:27

Hi Team,
Please find both parties GIA reports.

Thank you

** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Regards,

Lynn Khong
Executive Motor Claims
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6156 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: & i Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Lynn Khong

Sent: Monday, 1 August 2022 5:41 pm

To: Accounts ( Ding Auto ) <accounts@dingauto.sg>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments'
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; SA 0406 <sa0406 @dingauto.sg>; Claims Dept of CTI
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>




Subject: SNM22D205247/C02/KHONGLH | APPOINT LKK - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMU4180Y (INSD) & SKW3485M
ALONG COLLYER QUAY ON 27/07/2022 08:27

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Lynn,

We refer to your email of even date.

We will be appointing M/s LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to conduct the pre-repair survey (PRS) on your client's
vehicle.

We seek your cooperation to arrange the vehicle readily for dismantling with repair estimates during the pre-repair
survey.

Thank you

Hi LKK,

Please assist on survey.

Thank you

** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Regards,

Lynn Khong
Executive Motor Claims
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6156 | Tel: (65) 6389 6116 | F: (65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: & i Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Accounts ( Ding Auto ) <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 August 2022 5:12 pm

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Lynn Khong <lynn.khong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; SA 0406
<sa0406@dingauto.sg>

Subject: Re: O/R: SNM22D205247/C02/SMU4180Y/KHONGLH / RE: TP CLAIM: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW3485M &
SMU4180Y ON 27/07/2022 - CHECK LIABILITY




CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Boon Sen,
We will arrange for survey once liability is clear.
Kindly advise liability status, thank you.

Best Regards,

Lynn Yap
Accounts Department

+65 6452 1208
www.dingauto.sg accounts@dingauto.sq
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Singapore 575721

On Mon, Aug 1, 2022 at 5:11 PM Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping. com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Lynn,

Please conduct PRS for SKW3485M.

Note: officer in charge Lynn Khong 63896156.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid—19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy
documents to us as delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All
correspondence should be made via emailor fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is
much regretted.



Thank you

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www. sg. cntaiping. com | FB: www. facebook. com/chinataipingsg/ |  WeChat: XM
¥ Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named
recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or
dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e—mail
and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Accounts ( Ding Auto ) <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 August 2022 4:32 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; SA 0406 <sa0406 @dingauto.sg>

Subject: Re: TP CLAIM: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW3485M & SMU4180Y ON 27/07/2022 - CHECK LIABILITY

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Boon Seng,

The date and time of accident is on 27/07/2022 08:35hrs.

Kindly assist us to expedite the liability status as soon as possible, thank you.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Lynn Yap
Accounts Department

+65 6452 1208
www.dingauto.sg accounts@dingauto.sq
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Singapore 575721

On Mon, Aug 1, 2022 at 4:14 PM Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping. com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Lynn,

Can assist advise on accident timing asap to process pri.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid—-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy
documents to us as delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents. All
correspondence should be made via emailor fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is
much regretted.

Thank you

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
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DID: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www. sg. cntaiping. com | FB: www. facebook. com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: AR
¥ Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named
recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or
dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not
the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e—mail
and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Accounts ( Ding Auto ) <accounts@dingauto. sg>

Sent: Monday, 1 August 2022 2:41 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg. cntaiping. com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth. ding@dingauto. sg>; SA 0406 <sa0406@dingauto. sg>

Subject: Re: TP CLAIM: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKW3485M & SMU4180Y ON 27/07/2022 - CHECK
LIABILITY

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you

recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear China Taiping Motor Claim Officers,

We would like to check and follow up on the liability status.

Kindly revert to us with the liability status as soon as possible, thank you.

Best Regards,



Lynn Yap
Accounts Department

+65 6452 1208
www.dingauto.sq accounts@dingauto.sq
176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Singapore 575721

On Thu, Jul 28, 2022 at 10:47 AM Accounts ( Ding Auto ) <accounts@dingauto.sg> wrote:

Dear China Taiping Motor Claim Officers,

Good day to you.

Kindly refer to the attached GIA Report, Third Party Insurer Enquiries, Certificate of Insurance
and Accident Photos for your further viewing.

We would like to check the liability for this case.

Kindly revert to us the liability status for this case as soon as possible so that we can advise our
client and arrange the vehicle to be in for survey and repair.

Please do not hesitate to contact us for further assistance, thank you.
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Best Regards,
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Lynn Yap
Accounts Department

+65 6452 1208

www.dingauto.sq accounts@dingauto.sq

176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Singapore 575721
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