EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Candice <candice@premiumcarz.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 21 April 2023 3:39 pm

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: OFFER / Your Ref: CC4/AIS22007291/ea3 Our Ref: 0506/SLW5729K/TP/PC/0722 /
DOA:29.07.2022

Attachments: SLW5729K_LOD_PER INV_REVISED.pdf; SLW5729K_Final Bill_Allianz.pdf

Dear Ezlyna,

Attached LOD - revised and Final bill for SLW5729K for your necessary action.
Thank you.

Regards,

Candice Yee

PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6636 9100

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: 21 April 2023 15:00

To: Candice <candice@premiumcarz.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OFFER / Your Ref: CC4/A1S22007291/ea3 Our Ref: 0506/SLW5729K/TP/PC/0722 / DOA:29.07.2022

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at $$2,247.45 (all in) in full and final
settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured arising out
of this incident.

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / Warrant to
Act and your Bank details for us to process payment.

Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or
our insured as a result of the accident on 29-Jul-2022.

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability.
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Thank you.
*Pls forward a copy of Tax Invoice.

Warmest Regards,
Ezlyna

is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not
the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and
notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Candice <candice@premiumcarz.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, April 21, 2023 1:26 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: OFFER / Your Ref: CC4/AIS22007291/ea3 Our Ref: 0506/SLW5729K/TP/PC/0722

Dear Ezlyna,

We confirm acceptance as follows:
COR $2,000.00

LOU $ 240.00
SF S 7.45
Total $2,247.45

Please expedite with DV for our submission.
Thank you.

Regards,

PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6636 9100

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: 21 April 2023 12:39

To: Candice <candice@premiumcarz.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OFFER / Your Ref: CC4/A1S22007291/ea3 Our Ref: 0506/SLW5729K/TP/PC/0722

Without Prejudice
Dear Candice,

We refer to the above matter.



We have our principal’s instruction to offer as follows:-

Cost of Repair - $2,000.00 (Agreed) -Pls provide amended Tax Invoice

Loss of Use -S 240.00 (4 days x $60)
LTA search -S 7.45 (Agreed)
Total -$2,247.45

Kindly confirm acceptance and E-voucher will follow shortly. Thank you.

With warmest regards,
Ezlyna

From: Candice <candice@premiumcarz.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, January 30, 2023 6:02 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: CC4/AIS22007291/ea3 Our Ref: 0506/SLW5729K/TP/PC/0722

Dear Ezlyna,
Attached LOD for your necessary action.
Thank you.

Regards,

Candice Yee

PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTE LTD
1 kaki Bukit Ave 6

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6636 9100



