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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 1 August 2022 12:23 PM
To: Chunni motor Work
Subject: RE: Automatic reply: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 6335 P, YE 2888 U & OTHER ON 

29-08-2016// LKK Ref: CC4/AXA16016456/M1wb3s2
Attachments: DS FORM_SHB6335P.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 29 July 2022 12:39 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Automatic reply: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 6335 P, YE 2888 U & OTHER ON 29-08-2016// LKK Ref: 
CC4/AXA16016456/M1wb3s2 
 
(Without Prejudice) 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
thank you for your prompt reply. 
 
We confirm settlement for the property damage claim at $25000 globally. This settlement is without prejudice to our 
client's injury if any. 
 
Kindly forward us the discharge voucher for our client's execution. 
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Thank you for your kind assistance. 
 
Have a great weekend. 
 
Rgds 
Yan 
Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd 
96312800 
 
On Wednesday, 27 July 2022 at 05:35:41 pm SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
 
 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement at a global sum of $25,000.00(all-in). 

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

  



3

  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 May 2022 9:09 AM 
To: 'Chunni motor Work' <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: Automatic reply: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 6335 P, YE 2888 U & OTHER ON 29-08-2016// LKK 
Ref: CC4/AXA16016456/M1wb3s2 

  

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We are still pending mandate/instruction from AXA. 

We will follow up and get back to you asap. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 9 May 2022 11:40 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Automatic reply: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 6335 P, YE 2888 U & OTHER ON 29-08-2016// LKK 
Ref: CC4/AXA16016456/M1wb3s2 
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Your Ref : CC4/AXA16016456/M1wb3s2 

Our ref : SHB 6335 P (290816 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

  

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

  

We refer to your email of 27-04-2022. 

  

  

We trust that by now you should have seek mandate from your principal, M/s AXA Insurance Pte Ltd and kindly revert 
with your offer of an amicable settlement. 

  

  

Thank you and have a nice day ! 

  

  

Best Regards 

William 

Claims Department  

  

 
Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd 
Tat Ann Building 

No. 40 Japan Pemimpin  

#03-12 

Singapore 577185 
 
Tel : 6483-6016 (Claims) 
 
DISCLAIMER: 
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  
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If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached  
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby  
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination  
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be  
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.  

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this  

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission  

or any modification.  

  

 Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail? 

  

  

  

  

On Wednesday, 27 April 2022, 09:12:04 am SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:  

  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We are still pending mandate/instruction from AXA. 

  

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 25 April 2022 11:56 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Automatic reply: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 6335 P, YE 2888 U & OTHER ON 29-08-2016// LKK 
Ref: CC4/AXA16016456/M1wb3s2 

  

3RD REMINDER 

  

  

  

On Thursday, 7 April 2022, 10:56:29 am SGT, Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  

  

  

2ND REMINDER 

  

  

  

On Thursday, 10 March 2022, 02:50:32 pm SGT, Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  

  

  

REMINDER 
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On Monday, 28 February 2022, 02:58:07 pm SGT, Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  

  

  

Your Ref : CC4/AXA16016456/M1wb3s2 

Our  Ref : SHB 6335 P (290816) 

  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

  

Hi Hsiao Tong,  

  

  

We refer to your email of 21-01-2022. 

  

  

We trust that by now you should have seek mandate from your principals, M/s AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd and 
kindly revert with your offer of an amicable settlement as soon as possible.  

  

  

Thank you . 

  

  

Best Regards 

William 

Claims Department  
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Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd 

  

(New Address) 

#03-12 Tat Ann Building        

No. 40 Jalan Pemimpin 

Singapore 577185 

 
Tel : 6483-6016 (Claims) 

  

 
 
DISCLAIMER: 
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  
If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached  
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby  
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination  
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be  
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.  

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this  

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission  

or any modification.  

  

 Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail? 

  

  

On Thursday, 27 January 2022, 03:20:51 pm SGT, Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  

  

  

Your Ref : CC4/AXA16016456/M1wb3s2 

Our  Ref : SHB 6335 P (290816) 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

  

Hi Hsiao Tong,  

  

  

We refer to your email of 21-01-2022. 

  

  

We trust that by now you should have seek mandate from your principals, M/s AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd and 
kindly revert with your offer of an amicable settlement as soon as possible.  

  

  

Thank you . 

  

  

Best Regards 

William 

Claims Department  

  

  

Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd 

  

(New Address) 

#03-12 Tat Ann Building        

No. 40 Jalan Pemimpin 

Singapore 577185 

 
Tel : 6483-6016 (Claims) 
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DISCLAIMER: 
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  
If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached  
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby  
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination  
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be  
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.  

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this  

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission  

or any modification.  

  

 Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail? 

  

  

  

  

On Friday, 21 January 2022, 09:49:04 am SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:  

  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi, 

  

We are still pending for mandate from AXA. 

  

We will follow up and get back to you. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 

  

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 20 January 2022 3:44 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Automatic reply: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 6335 P, YE 2888 U & OTHER ON 29-08-2016// LKK 
Ref: CC4/AXA16016456/M1wb3s2 

  

    2ND REMINDER 

  

On Friday, 14 January 2022, 03:40:02 pm SGT, Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  

  

  

REMINDER 

  

  

  

On Tuesday, 11 January 2022, 03:09:43 pm SGT, Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  
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On Thursday, 30 December 2021, 11:36:57 am SGT, Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  

  

  

  

Your Ref : CC4/AXA16016456/M1 

Our  Ref : SHB 6335 P (290816) 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Hsiao Tong  

  

  

We refer to below email. 

  

  

We trust that by now you have seek mandate from your principals and kindly revert to us as soon as possible. 

  

  

Thank you.  

  

  

  

  

Best Regards 

William  

claims Department 
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Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd 

  

(New Address) 

#03-12 Tat Ann Building        

No. 40 Jalan Pemimpin 

Singapore 577185 

 
Tel : 6483-6016 (Claims) 

  

 
 
DISCLAIMER: 
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  
If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached  
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby  
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination  
of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be  
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.  

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this  

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission  

or any modification.  

  

 Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail? 

  

  

On Thursday, 23 December 2021, 09:22:49 am SGT, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:  

  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We are still pending for mandate approval from AXA. 
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We will follow up and get back to you. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Chunni motor Work <chunnimw@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 December 2021 3:34 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Automatic reply: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 6335 P, YE 2888 U & OTHER ON 29-08-2016// LKK 
Ref: CC4/AXA16016456/M1wb3s2 

  

Your Ref : CC4/AXA16016456/M1W3S2 

Our Ref : SHB 6335 P (290816) 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

  

Your email of 10-12-2021. 
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We trust that by now you should have seek mandate from your principals and kindly revert with your offer as soon as 
possible. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards 

William  

claims Department 

  

Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd 

  

(New Address) 

#03-12 Tat Ann Building        

No. 40 Jalan Pemimpin 

Singapore 577185 

 
Tel : 6483-6016 (Claims) 

  

 
 
DISCLAIMER: 
This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  
It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  


