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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 July 2022 8:44 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Resend- : Seek Mandate - C0398006

Dear Hsiao Tong 
 
Please proceed as per mandate below 
 

Regards  

 
Yvonne Ang  
Assistant Manager-  Motor (Property) Claims 
Motor (Property) Claims | AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 
Mailing address: Robinson Road P.O. Box 1094, Singapore 902144 
Customer Centre: 9 North Buona Vista Drive, #18-01/06 The Metropolis Tower 1, Singapore 138588  
 
Telephone:       +65 68804888 
Email:                 yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg  
 

 

Please consider the environment before printing this message.  
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. 
If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately. 

 
 

Internal 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2022 2:40 PM 
To: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Resend- : Seek Mandate - C0398006 
 
Dear Yvonne, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
YE2888U(OI) -> SHB6335P(TP) - > SLD8139T -> SJC4308C 
 
This is a 4 vehicles chain collision whereby our insured was the last vehicle. In accordance with the MCF guideline for 
chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd" at $25,554.42(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $21,400.00 
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2. Loss of Rental (23days x $130.54) $  3,002.42 
3. Loss of Income (23days x $50.00) $  1,150.00 
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          2.00 

Total $25,554.42 
 

Book Value : $ 65,000.00 (est) 
LTA Rebate : $ 45,000.00 (est) 
Nett Value : $ 20,000.00 (est) 

 
We have uploaded all the relevant documents in Merimen for your review. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 
From: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 July 2022 2:36 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Resend- : Seek Mandate - C0398006 
 
Hi Hsiao Tong 
 
 
Can call me 68804461  
 

Regards  

 
Yvonne Ang  
Assistant Manager-  Motor (Property) Claims 
Motor (Property) Claims | AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 
Mailing address: Robinson Road P.O. Box 1094, Singapore 902144 
Customer Centre: 9 North Buona Vista Drive, #18-01/06 The Metropolis Tower 1, Singapore 138588  
 
Telephone:       +65 68804888 
Email:                 yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg  
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Please consider the environment before printing this message.  
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. 
If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately. 

 
From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 2:20 PM 
To: ANG Yvonne <yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg> 
Cc: chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: Resend- : Seek Mandate - C0398006 
 

This mail is associated with : 
*SHB6335P (C0398006) 

[YE2888U] 
TP 

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD 
Aug 29 2016 6:00AM 
[CHAN, CHEN CHYE] 

Chunni Motor Work Pte Ltd 
Hi Yvonne, 
  
Please advise AXA claim officer for this matter. 
  
Third party is asking for an offer as the case is going to time bar soon. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Hsiao Tong 
  
  
<-- Original Message -->  
From: LKK_HQ  
To: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg 
CC: AXA_SG; chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Sent On: 10/05/2022 09:08 AM 
Subject: RE: Resend- : Seek Mandate - C0398006 
   
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to our mandate request. 
  
Kindly advise as third party is chasing for offer. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Hsiao Tong 
  
  
<-- Original Message -->  
From: LKK_HQ  
To: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg 
CC: AXA_SG; chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Sent On: 27/04/2022 09:10 AM 
Subject: RE: Resend- : Seek Mandate - C0398006 
   
<-- Original Message -->  
From: LKK_HQ  
To: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg 
CC: AXA_SG; chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Sent On: 28/02/2022 05:54 PM 
Subject: RE: Resend- : Seek Mandate - C0398006 
   
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
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We refer to our mandate request. 
  
Kindly advise. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Hsiao Tong 
  
  
  
  
<-- Original Message -->  
From: LKK_HQ  
To: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg 
CC: AXA_SG; chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Sent On: 21/01/2022 09:47 AM 
Subject: RE: Resend- : Seek Mandate - C0398006 
   
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to our mandate request. 
  
Kindly advise. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Hsiao Tong 
  
  
<-- Original Message -->  
From: LKK_HQ  
To: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg 
CC: AXA_SG; chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Sent On: 17/12/2021 09:18 AM 
Subject: RE: Resend- : Seek Mandate - C0398006 
   
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to our mandate request. 
  
Kindly advise. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Hsiao Tong 
  
  
<-- Original Message -->  
From: LKK_HQ  
To: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg 
CC: AXA_SG; chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Sent On: 04/10/2021 01:43 PM 
Subject: Resend- : Seek Mandate - C0398006 
   
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
Resend with the amended total amount.  
  
Hsiao Tong 
  
  
  
<-- Original Message -->  
From: LKK_HQ  
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To: kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg 
CC: AXA_SG; chewht@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 
Sent On: 04/10/2021 01:41 PM 
Subject: Seek Mandate - C0398006 
   
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
This is a total 4 vehicleschain collision whereby OI was the last car. 
  
We would like to seek your mandate up to $25,554.42(all-in). 
  
**Book Value: $65,000.00(est) less LTA Rebate: $45,000.00(est) = NBV :$20,000.00(est) 
  
We have upoloaded all the relevant documents in Merimen for your easy reference. 
  
Kindly let us have your mandate after review the matter. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Hsiao Tong 
  
  
 
 
This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this email.  
 
Sent by : CHEW HSIAO TONG (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)  
 

Internal 
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are not the 
intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have received this 
message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this message are solely those of 
the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless 
otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are not the 
intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have received this 
message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this message are solely those of 
the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other entity of the AXA Group, unless 
otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by  
AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any  
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is  
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify  
the sender immediately. 
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are 
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have 
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this 
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other 
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  
-----Disclaimer----- 
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are 
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have 
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this 
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other 
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  
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This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by  
AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any  
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is  
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify  
the sender immediately. 


