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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 September 2022 3:17 PM

To: hingleemotor@yahoo.com.sg

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SKA 6250U

Hi Boss, 

 

As spoken, the lumpsum I made mistake on the lumpsum amount. It should be L/S $ 4,100 with 6 days 

repair. 

 

Kindly acknowledge 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  
The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary....  

 

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 21 September 2022 11:29 am 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Fw: SKA 6250U  

  

case finalised 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  
The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Seng Peng Lai <hingleemotor@yahoo.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 21 September 2022 11:25 am 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SKA 6250U  

  

Rasul 

we accept your recommendation COR lump sum $5000.00 and  6 working  days  

we will submit claim on 28.9.22 
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thanks  

SPLAI  

Hing Lee motor  

 

 

 

 

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android 

 

On Tue, 20 Sept 2022 at 11:45, Rasul (LKKAuto) 
<Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Boss, 
  

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $5,000.00 /- with 06 days of 

repair, subject to their approval. 

 

 
Best Regards,   

Rasul | Assessor   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd   

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315   

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)   

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.   

 

 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Tuesday, 20 September 2022 11:12 am 

To: hinglee@pacific.net.sg <hinglee@pacific.net.sg> 

Subject: SKA 6250U  

  

Hi Boss, 
  

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $5,000.00 /- with 06 days of 

repair, subject to their approval. 

 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 


