Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 6 September 2022 5:18 PM
To: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); SUR
Subject: RE: SMQ 2271 C

Dear Pat,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm final fig $4,189.80 before excess $0/- & GST and 5 repair days.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 1 September 2022 9:42 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: SMQ 2271 C

Finalize checked. Kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 1 September 2022 11:02 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMQ 2271 C

Dear Steve,

As requested, please see attached.
Thanks,

Pat

Shu Fatt Auto Works



From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 31, 2022 5:09 PM

To: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SMQ 2271 C

Hi Pat,

Can resent me.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 31 August 2022 9:43 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMQ 2271 C

Hi Steve,

Supplier bill emailed on 23 August 2022.
Thanks & regards,

Pat

Shu Fatt Auto Works

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 10:20 PM

To: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SMQ 2271 C

Hi Pat,

Request supplier bill.



Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 August 2022 2:40 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SMQ 2271 C

Dear Steve / Shiau Chan,

Breakdown as follows:
Parts: 2668.00
+10%: 266.80
2934.80
Sent: 55.00
2989.80
Labour:1200.00

Regards,
Pat
Shu Fatt Auto Works

From: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, August 30, 2022 2:34 PM

To: 'Steve Chen (LKK Auto)' <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; 'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)' <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SMQ 2271 C

Dear Steve / Shiau Chan,

Please confirm finalized COR $4189.80. Attached after paint photos.
Excess: 0

Thanks & regards,
Pat
Shu Fatt Auto Works

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 23, 2022 10:36 PM




To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: SMQ 2271 C

Hi Shiau Chan,

I've checked the finalize. Kindly assist.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ikkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pat-Shu Fatt Auto Works <shufatt@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 August 2022 11:32 am

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@|kkauto.com>
Subject: SMQ 2271 C

Dear Shiau Chan / Steve,
Stock for the front bumper arrived and we have on 22 August 2022 replaced the bumper for Insured.

Please see attached repair estimates (marked), supplementary (submitted on 2 August) and the supplier invoices.
As we are unable to access the estimate to reflect the correct part prices, please help to do the needful.

Thanks & regards,
Pat
Shu Fatt Auto Works



