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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 14 November 2022 3:48 PM
To: joseph.lhwong@gmail.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM5230J (CHINA TAIPING) AND SMM7283G AT/ALONG 

SELEGIE ROAD ON 23/07/2022

Our Ref: CC6/CTI22007127/Kga3 
 
Insured Name : Wong Lai Huat 
Insured Driver : Wong Lai Huat 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
                                           
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM5230J (CHINA TAIPING) AND SMM7283G AT/ALONG SELEGIE ROAD ON 
23/07/2022 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.
 
We have received a claim from SMM7283G against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s favour. 
Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler   

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 December 2022 5:48 pm
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] / SNM22D205225/C02/SLM5230J/CHNGPW / FW: Direct 

Settlement - Accident Involving SLM5230J (OI : CTI - TBA) and SMM7283G  (TP : LKK 
REF - CC6/CTI22007127/ga3) on 23/07/2022

Attachments: CTP-Fund Transfer Request Form-FA-Editable.pdf

 
 
Without Prejudice, Save as to Costs 
 
 
Dear Ezlyna 
 
Please proceed to resolve claim at $1,417.95 and avoid settle in global sum. 
 
Please get workshop to complete the attach payment if workshop would like to effect payment via bank transfer. 
 
 
 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Adeline Chng 
Claims Department  
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6155   |   F: (65) 6224 7175     
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify 
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
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From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, December 15, 2022 9:46 AM 
To: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE:[SEEK MANDATE] / SNM22D205225/C02/SLM5230J/CHNGPW / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving 
SLM5230J (OI : CTI - TBA) and SMM7283G (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22007127/ga3) on 23/07/2022 
 

 

Your ref: SNM22D205225/C02/SLM5230J/CHNGPW 
LKK ref : CC6/CTI22007127/ga3 
 
Dear Adelaine, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLM5230J  (CHINA TAIPING) AND SMM7283G  (TP) ON 23/07/2022 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
It is under BOLA 27 scenario.  Insured rear ended Third Party’s vehicle.  We are of the view that liability is on our 
driver’s. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “Wei Lee Motor Works” at $1,417.95 (all-in). 
 
The summary is as follows: - 
 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  


	f0ae6c8f07c8e9af79ab329deead421ab24cdc03446d4673bec6e52f43e5dc60.pdf
	f0ae6c8f07c8e9af79ab329deead421ab24cdc03446d4673bec6e52f43e5dc60.pdf
	a56a8b6c7952433e7ed5f957546a407ecada90bc70ddd3537f00394fb61b3ab4.pdf
	f0ae6c8f07c8e9af79ab329deead421ab24cdc03446d4673bec6e52f43e5dc60.pdf
	f0ae6c8f07c8e9af79ab329deead421ab24cdc03446d4673bec6e52f43e5dc60.pdf
	a56a8b6c7952433e7ed5f957546a407ecada90bc70ddd3537f00394fb61b3ab4.pdf
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style

