Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Celine,

Nagiah <riaz@justice.com.sg>

Monday, 19 September 2022 5:23 PM

Celine Fong (LKKAuto); 'Cassandra Kang'; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
SUR; ridhwan.riaz@gmail.com; cann@Icp.com.sg

RE: MC/MC 5743/2020 - Paper Re-Survey of SLU 2768C (Riaz Ref:
WAN.VK.514011.Q(W) | LCP Ref: LC/CK/2021-0042)

You may bill 50% to RIAZ LLC and 50% to Lawrence Chua Practice LLC.

We will make payment to you accordingly.

Kindly let us have the SJE Report soonest possible.

Regards,

Nagiah

Paralegal to Mr. Vengadesh
Riaz LLC

Advocates and Solicitors

Tel: 6534 0110 | Fax: 6534 0220

Disclaimer: This message is privileged and confidential and is intended solely for the name recipient. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If this e-mail
has reached you in error, please delete the e-mail immediately and inform of the error by sending an e-mail to
riaz@justice.com.sg Though internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost or infected with viruses, we have canned this message to minimize the possibility of corruption.

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 September 2022 12:06 PM

To: Cassandra Kang <cassandra@Icp.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; ridhwan.riaz@gmail.com; riaz@justice.com.sg; cann@Icp.com.sg

Subject: RE: MC/MC 5743/2020 - Paper Re-Survey of SLU 2768C (Riaz Ref: WAN.VK.514011.Q(W) | LCP Ref:

LC/CK/2021-0042)

Hi Cassandra,

We are in midst of preparing the report, please advised on the billing.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Cassandra Kang <cassandra@I|cp.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 August 2022 12:43 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; ridhwan.riaz@gmail.com;
riaz@justice.com.sg; cann@Icp.com.sg

Subject: Re: MC/MC 5743/2020 - Paper Re-Survey of SLU 2768C (Riaz Ref: WAN.VK.514011.Q(W) | LCP Ref:
LC/CK/2021-0042)

Dear Veron,

MC/MC 5743/2020 - Paper Re-Survey of SLU 2768C

We refer to the above-captioned matter and your email dated 1 August 2022.

Further to our email dated 4 August 2022, please find attached the full set of survey photographs from
FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd for your kind attention.

Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Cassandra Kang (Ms) | Associate

LAWRENCE CHUA PRACTICE LLC | 33 Kreta Ayer Road, Singapore 088999

Tel : 6221 1311 | DID : 6671 8349 | Fax :6221 1084 | Email : cassandra@I|cp.com.sg
Our Ref: LC/CK/2021-0042

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION : This message is intended for the use of the named recipient only, and may contain privileged and confidential information. If
you are not the intended recipient, you should delete the email immediately and must not disseminate, distribute or copy any information herein. Please
inform us of the error immediately by sending an email to cassandra@Icp.com.sq. Thank you.

On Thu, 4 Aug 2022 at 14:43, Cassandra Kang <cassandra@Icp.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Veron,
We refer to your email dated 1 August 2022.

Apologies, we had left out pg. 7 of FormTeam's photographs in our earlier email dated 1 July 2022. We
attach herewith FormTeam's survey report and photographs for your reference.

We will check with our clients and FormTeam if there are any other photographs.
Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Cassandra Kang (Ms) | Associate

LAWRENCE CHUA PRACTICE LLC | 33 Kreta Ayer Road, Singapore 088999

Tel : 6221 1311 | DID : 6671 8349 | Fax : 6221 1084 | Email : cassandra@I|cp.com.sg
Our Ref: LC/CK/2021-0042

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION : This message is intended for the use of the named recipient only, and may contain privileged and confidential
information. If you are not the intended recipient, you should delete the email immediately and must not disseminate, distribute or copy any information
herein. Please inform us of the error immediately by sending an email to cassandra@lcp.com.sg. Thank you.



On Mon, 1 Aug 2022 at 16:05, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Cassandra,

Kindly provides all photos from Form Team including after repaired , we only received 17 pcs.

Please advised on the billing.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cassandra Kang <cassandra@Icp.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 July 2022 7:09 PM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; ridhwan.riaz@gmail.com; riaz@justice.com.sg; cann@Icp.com.sg
Subject: Re: MC/MC 5743/2020 - Paper Re-Survey of SLU 2768C (Riaz Ref: WAN.VK.514011.Q(W) | LCP Ref:
LC.CK/2021-0042)

Dear Celine,



MC/MC 5743/2020 - Paper Re-Survey of SLU 2768C

We refer to the above-captioned matter and our email dated 1 July 2022.

Please let us know if the SJE report is ready.

Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Cassandra Kang (Ms) | Associate

LAWRENCE CHUA PRACTICE LLC | 33 Kreta Ayer Road, Singapore 088999

Tel : 6221 1311 | DID : 6671 8349 | Fax : 6221 1084 | Email : cassandra@I|cp.com.sg
Our Ref: LC.CK/2021-0042

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION : This message is intended for the use of the named recipient only, and may contain privileged and confidential
information. If you are not the intended recipient, you should delete the email immediately and must not disseminate, distribute or copy any information
herein. Please inform us of the error immediately by sending an email to cassandra@lcp.com.sg. Thank you.

On Mon, 4 Jul 2022 at 18:34, Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Cassandra,

We acknowledge receipt of the email dated 01.07.2022.

We will proceed accordingly.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Cassandra Kang <cassandra@I|cp.com.sg>

Date: Fri, 1 Jul 2022 at 19:00

Subject: MC/MC 5743/2020 - Paper Re-Survey of SLU 2768C (Riaz Ref: WAN.VK.514011.Q(W) | LCP Ref:
LC.CK/2021-0042)

To: <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>, <riaz@justice.com.sg>, Muhd Ridhwan
<ridhwan.riaz@gmail.com>, Cann Lee <cann@I|cp.com.sg>

Dear Sirs,

MC/MC 5743/2020 - Paper Re-Survey of SLU 2768C

We refer to the above-captioned matter.

Please find attached our letter of even date with enclosures for your kind attention.

Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Cassandra Kang (Ms) | Associate

LAWRENCE CHUA PRACTICE LLC | 33 Kreta Ayer Road, Singapore 088999

Tel : 6221 1311 | DID : 6671 8349 | Fax :6221 1084 | Email : cassandra@I|cp.com.sg
Our Ref: LC/CK/2021-0042

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION : This message is intended for the use of the named recipient only, and may contain privileged and confidential
information. If you are not the intended recipient, you should delete the email immediately and must not disseminate, distribute or copy any information
herein. Please inform us of the error immediately by sending an email to cassandra@lcp.com.sg. Thank you.

NOTE : In line with the recent COVID-19 measures, our office is currently mainly working from home. As we may not have ready
access to our files, our response time to emails received may be slower. We will endeavour to reply to your email as soon as we can.
We thank you for your understanding during this period.



