From: Claims claims@budgetdirect.com.sg
Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10016551/JY Il Ol- SMC4247J (Silver) TP- SMV6878A Il Est: $0.00 Il SL Motor Repair
Date: 26 July 2022 at 10:33 AM
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) admin-d@lkkauto.com, SUR sur@lkkauto.com, assignments assignments@|kkauto.com
Cc: Teo Jie Yang jieyang.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg, Kenneth Lim kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg, Derrick Quok
derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg

Hi Team,

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SMV6878A

S L MOTOR REPAIR

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Autobay #01-95

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6969 8890 H/P: 9761 3530 (Ah Lek)
Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.

Best regards,

Salizawati Haizar
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E salizawati.h@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: claims@juseq.com.sg <claims@juseq.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 July 2022 6:14 pm

To: Claims <claims @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Teo Jie Yang <jieyang.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRS Request on 25.07.2022 Il Our ref: C10016551/JY || PRE-REPAIR
INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMV6878A & SMC4247J ON 23/7/2022 @
1740 HOURS

Dear Sirs

Your Ref; SMC4247J
Our Ref: JEQ/ SMV6878A /0722 (SLMR)

NOTICE OF ACCIDENT - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - OUR CLIENTS’ / CLIENT’S VEHICLE:
SMV6878A

We refer to your email of yesterday’s date.

Our client is agreeable to the appointment of Mr. Adrian Ling - LKK the single joint expert (SJE)
to insnact his fher vehirle SMV/RR7RA
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We would like to inform that our client’s vehicle SMV6878A is available for pre-repair inspection at
the workshop as stated in our previous email.

Please inform your surveyor, Mr. Adrian Ling - LKK to communicate with our client’s repairers
directly with regard to the arrangements of pre-repair inspection (incl. damaged parts are being
dismantled prior to the commencement of repairs) and post-repair inspection of our client’s vehicle
SMV6878A.

Thank you.
Regards

Foo Kevin
On behalf of Mr. Caleb Tan
JusEquity Law Corporation

From: claims@juseq.com.sg <claims@juseq.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 July 2022 3:04 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: NOTICE OF ACCIDENT - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SMV6878A & SMC4247] ON 23/7/2022 @ 1740 HOURS

Dear Sirs

Your Ref: SMC4247J
Our Ref: JEQ/ SMV6878A /0722 (SLMR)

NOTICE OF ACCIDENT - PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - OUR CLIENTS’ / CLIENT’S VEHICLE:
SMV6878A

We act for the owner / owners of motor vehicle no. SMV6878A.

We are instructed to claim for damages against you in connection with the above accident and
copy of our clients’ / client’s report is attached herewith for your attention.

Pursuant to NIMA protocol, we hereby give you notice to conduct a pre-repair inspection of our
clients’ / client’s motor vehicle no. SMV6878A.

We would like to inform that our clients/ client will be sending their / his / her vehicle no.
SMV6878A to the workshop as stated below: -

S L MOTOR REPAIR

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Autobay #01-95
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6969 8890 H/P: 9761 3530 (Ah Lek)



TAKE NOTICE that you are required to respond to us within 2 working days (excluding Saturday,
Sunday and Public Holiday) of receipt of this notice as to whether you wish to carry out or waive a
pre-repair inspection. If we do not hear from you in this regard by the stipulated time, we shall
construe your silence as waiver of the requirement for a pre-repair inspection and our clients’ /
client’s repairers shall proceed to repair our clients’ / client’s vehicle no. SMV6878A.

We look forward to hearing from you by the stipulated time.
Regards
Foo Kevin

On behalf of Mr. Caleb Tan
JusEquity Law Corporation
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