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RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - SNM22D205276/C02/SJG9989H/TAYHP - Direct Settlement -
Accident Involving SJG9989H (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SNA8875T (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI22007084/Upa3) on 25/07/2022

Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Fri 4/11/2022 9:24 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Dear Mdm,
 
Please proceed to offer repairer “FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" at $23,552.00(all-in).
 
Best Regards,
 
Irene
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 6389 6192  |   F: (65) 6224 7175
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城
Taiping SG
 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 7 October 2022 9:27 AM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - SNM22D205276/C02/SJG9989H/TAYHP - Direct Settlement - Accident
Involving SJG9989H (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SNA8875T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22007084/Upa3) on 25/07/2022
 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to our mandate request dated 08/09/2022.
 
Kindly let us have your approval/instruction.
 
Thank you.
 
 
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fcheckpoint.url-protection.com%2Fv1%2Furl%3Fo%3Dhttps%253A%2F%2Fapc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com%2F%253Furl%253Dhttp%25253A%25252F%25252Fwww.sg.cntaiping.com%25252F%2526amp%253Bdata%253D05%25257C01%25257Cirene.tay%252540sg.cntaiping.com%25257Ce8e058b8339a4be8c6b908da5d6e8ca4%25257C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%25257C0%25257C0%25257C637925026668570333%25257CUnknown%25257CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%25253D%25257C3000%25257C%25257C%25257C%2526amp%253Bsdata%253DuYZXNra0v8tHvOfwFEB28%25252F4Y%25252BxoPrSMYIiZXAi1DVOY%25253D%2526amp%253Breserved%253D0%26g%3DMWY0MDNmYmUwODc2MGFjMA%3D%3D%26h%3DZDA1YWY1OGFjNTA5MGM3OTNlYzZjNmMzZTFhM2M1NDA5MGExMGU1ZjMzMWE3ZDE0NmY4Y2FmMTViMWU0MTcwMA%3D%3D%26p%3DYzJlOmN0aXNnOmM6bzpiNzNjOTUyMTM0MDBkNWExOGM4NDc3MDU0ZDc2OTkzOTp2MTpoOlQ%3D&data=05%7C01%7Cirene.tay%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Cd81158fd5299461b18ae08dabbe7de5e%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C638028901829864775%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=K7WyO1itCCH22Czla7iYAXOVMGQCvsNluG6xeuNYWhY%3D&reserved=0
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fcheckpoint.url-protection.com%2Fv1%2Furl%3Fo%3Dhttps%253A%2F%2Fapc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com%2F%253Furl%253Dhttp%25253A%25252F%25252Fwww.facebook.com%25252Fchinataipingsg%25252F%2526amp%253Bdata%253D05%25257C01%25257Cirene.tay%252540sg.cntaiping.com%25257Ce8e058b8339a4be8c6b908da5d6e8ca4%25257C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%25257C0%25257C0%25257C637925026668570333%25257CUnknown%25257CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%25253D%25257C3000%25257C%25257C%25257C%2526amp%253Bsdata%253DDzU51oCpxbUttaOAzC37guh09Lk3%25252Fn6LUsIRtk1GJN0%25253D%2526amp%253Breserved%253D0%26g%3DY2U5MTRiYmM1ZDZjZTg0NA%3D%3D%26h%3DMWRkYjc2OTY0MjMyYjdlYTJlMTI5YzZmYjNhZGM3ODM5YWQ5ZWU3NThlMjkwZmFiN2YzNDgxNzJmZjJiMTVmMg%3D%3D%26p%3DYzJlOmN0aXNnOmM6bzpiNzNjOTUyMTM0MDBkNWExOGM4NDc3MDU0ZDc2OTkzOTp2MTpoOlQ%3D&data=05%7C01%7Cirene.tay%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Cd81158fd5299461b18ae08dabbe7de5e%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C638028901829864775%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=RIqPD6M%2BN60Q0hpkiPP16e9Cv37C556Q%2FiOZENQUYic%3D&reserved=0
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2022 12:55 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - SNM22D205276/C02/SJG9989H/TAYHP - Direct Settlement - Accident Involving
SJG9989H (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SNA8875T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22007084/Upa3) on 25/07/2022
 
Your ref: SNM22D205276/C02/SJG9989H/TAYHP
LKK ref : CC6/CTI22007084/Upa3q2
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJG9989H(CHINA TAIPING) / SNA8875T(TP) /OTHERS ON 25/07/2022
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
SJH7993C -> SJG9989H(OI) -> SNA8875T(TP)-> SLW6985E
 
This is a 4 vehicles chain collision whereby our insured was the 3rd vehicle. In accordance with the MCF
guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%.
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" at $23,552.00(all-in).
 
The summary is as follows: -
 

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 60,782.42 $ 22,470.00 ($21,000.00 + 7%GST)
2. Loss of Use (8days x $200.00) $   1,600.00 $       960.00 (8days x $120.00)
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          2.00 $           2.00
4. Towing Fee $      120.00 $       120.00

Total $ 62,504.42 $ 23,552.00
 
Surveyor recommended 7days for repair + 1Sunday = 8days.
 

Market Value : $ 95,000.00 (est)
LTA Rebate : $ 53,610.00 (est)
Nett Value : $ 41,390.00 (est)

 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 07/09/2022 is only for mandate purpose.
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.
 
 

 
Best Regards,

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
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Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 31 August 2022 2:21 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SNM22D205276/C02/SJG9989H/TAYHP - Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJG9989H (OI :
CTI - TBA) AND SNA8875T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22007084/Upa3) on 25/07/2022
 
Dear All,
 
Enclosed herewith insured SAS REPORT. (PW. SJG9989H)
 
Regards,
 
Irene Tay
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, 25 August 2022 3:42 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: SNM22D205276/C02/SJG9989H/TAYHP - Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJG9989H (OI : CTI -
TBA) AND SNA8875T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI22007084/Upa3) on 25/07/2022
 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
Enclosed for your perusal is: -
 

Estimated cost of repair.
Preliminary advice.
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition.

 
Kindly let us have a copy of insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
 
Thank you.
 
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 15 August 2022 4:41 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJG9989H (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SNA8875T (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI22007084/Upa3) on 25/07/2022
 
Dear Sir / Madam,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, 3 August 2022 11:54 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJG9989H (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SNA8875T (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI22007084/Upa3) on 25/07/2022
 
Part 2 of 2
 
Enclosed TP rear video
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Wednesday, 3 August 2022 11:53 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJG9989H (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SNA8875T (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI22007084/Upa3) on 25/07/2022
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Part 1 of 2
 
Dear Sir / Madam,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We have inspected TP vehicle SNA 8875T at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit on 26/07/2022 on a
WP basis and TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:

-                TP GIA report

-                TP front and video footage
 
Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.
 
We will get back to you on preliminary advice.
 
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
 
Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong.
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
 
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

mailto:MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

