
1

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 August 2022 10:44 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: BEFORE AFTER PAINT & FINALISATION FOR SBS6327U d.o.a : 21.07.2022 

Hi Steve 
We agree with your finalized p/p COR of$2,420.96 before GST with 2 working days.  

 
Thank You 

 

 

 

Best Regards 

 
Senior Executive, Claims 
Mobile   +65 9199 0025 
Email     bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg 

 

 

 

 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, August 15, 2022 5:47 PM 

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: BEFORE AFTER PAINT & FINALISATION FOR SBS6327U d.o.a : 21.07.2022 

 

[EXTERNAL EMAIL]  
Hi Lynn, 

 

Kindly refer our finalize $2420.96 (P/P, before GST). 2 days. 
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Thanks. 

 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 

Sent: Sunday, 14 August 2022 8:51 am 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team 

<cs-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg> 

Subject: BEFORE AFTER PAINT & FINALISATION FOR SBS6327U d.o.a : 21.07.2022  

  

Hi Steve 

Please find attached photos and kindly finalise soonest.  

  
Thank You 
  
  
  
Best Regards 

 
Senior Executive, Claims 
Mobile   +65 9199 0025 
Email     bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg 

  

  

  

  

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, July 22, 2022 3:28 PM 

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>; Wei Siong Liam <WeiSiong.Liam@towertransit.sg> 

Subject: SBS6327U d.o.a : 21.07.2022 

  

[EXTERNAL EMAIL]  
Hi Lynn, 
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Discuss with Jason the estimate. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

Thanks. 

  
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 

Sent: Friday, 22 July 2022 3:16 pm 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; Wei Siong Liam <WeiSiong.Liam@towertransit.sg> 

Subject: SBS6327U d.o.a : 21.07.2022  

  

Hi Steve 

Please find attached  

  

Thank You 
  
  
  
Best Regards 

 
Senior Executive, Claims 
Mobile   +65 9199 0025 
Email     bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg 
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[Security Reminder] This email was sent from outside the organisation - please use 
caution when clicking on links or opening attachments. 
[Security Reminder] This email was sent from outside the organisation - please use 
caution when clicking on links or opening attachments. 


