From:
Subject:
Date:
To:

Cc:

MTPRI MTPRI@smrt.com.sg

FW: Our Ref : D22002246MFSH/STRIDES/TPD-1 // RE: Direct Settlement For SGU1000A & SHF277S
22 July 2022 at 3:34 PM

assignments assignments@lkkauto.com, Admin A admin-a@|kkauto.com

MTPRI MTPRI@smrt.com.sg, Magnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)
Ana.Magnaye @strides.com.sg

Ref: TAX/07/22/2066

Dear Yan,
Kindly survey on “ Without Prejudice” basis.

TP: SGU1000A
Insured: SHF277S
Workshop: Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

Thank you.
Regards,

Hua Yen
Claim Department

Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705
DID: 6866 2650 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 July 2022 11:55 am

To: MTPRI <MTPRI@smrt.com.sg>; Ong Hua Yen (Strides Automotive Services Pte
Ltd) <HuaYen.Ong@strides.com.sg>

Cc: Magnaye Ana Margie Marasigan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)
<Ana.Magnaye @strides.com.sg>; Joanne Tan Jo Ann
<joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Our Ref : D22002246MFSH/STRIDES/TPD-1 // RE: Direct Settlement
For SGU1000A & SHF277S

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments
unless you recognise the sender and are expecting the content or attachment.

Dear Hua Yen,

Kindly assist to arrange for PRI.
Thank you.

Chris Lim
Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore
068877

| Tel: 6507 3848 DID : 6507 3853 | Fax No. : 6507 3849 I|Email:
Chrlsle@msflrstcaijltaI vital.com.sg ICompany Regn. No. 195000106C

A Member of Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):



Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your
personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA
Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If
you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward,
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete
the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by
return e-mail.

From: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 July 2022 11:52 am

To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim @mesfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Ana.Magnaye @strides.com.sg

Subject: Re: Our Ref : D22002246MFSH/STRIDES/TPD-1 // RE: Direct Settlement
For SGU1000A & SHF277S

Hi Chris,

Noted thanks. Please assist to assign surveyor. Vehicle is with us.

Richmond Ho
Senior Service Consultant

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

Mobile. (65) 9176 8543

Direct. (65) 6430 4890
website. www.wearnesauto.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be
privileged. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by
reply email and then delete this message from your system. Please do not
copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any
attachment to any other person. Thank you.



On 22 Jul 2022, at 11:47, Lim Gan Koon (Chris)
<ChrisLim @msfirstcapital.com.sg> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Richmond,

We refer to your email below.
Liabilty is clear for this matter.
Regards.

Chris Lim
Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01
Singapore 068877

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 | Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email:
ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg ICompany Regn. No. 195000106C

A Member of

Insurance Group

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the
processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data
Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally
privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may
not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this
message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your
system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail.

From: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>
Sent: Friday, 22 July 2022 11:24 am

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: Direct Settlement For SGU1000A & SHF277S
Importance: High

Hi

Please see attached and check if possible for direct settlement

Richmond Ho



Senior Service Consultant
Body & Paint — Insurance Claim

Weames Automotive Pte Ltd

V 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4890 M (65) 9176 8543
WEARNES wvav.weamesauto.com  richmond.ho@wearnes.com

This email, including any aftachment, is confidential and may also be pnvileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.



