Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 November 2022 2:42 PM

To: alicechau@kanfs.net; Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: YK3288M (OD) - Finalization & photo
Dear Alice,

Confirmed COR $1853.50 before excess S600 @ 2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: alicechau <alicechau@kanfs.net>

Sent: Sunday, 30 October 2022 9:17 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: YK3288M (OD) - Finalization & photo

Dear Sir,

With reference to the mentioned vehicle, please confirm and finalise.
Thank you.

Regards,

Alice

Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop

Tel:6747 9560
Fax:6748 1006



