Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, July 20, 2022 4:27 PM

To: ‘Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)’; Admin A

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: NEW TP DS claim : Allianz ref - SIN34388M / Our ref - 437SLX1Z M3 / 4-7-2022 / TP

Claim - Allianz / Survey +

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 July 2022 3:56 PM

To: jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: admin-a@lkkauto.com; admin-d@Ilkkauto.com

Subject: NEW TP DS claim : Allianz ref - SIN34388M / Our ref - 437SLX1Z M3 / 4-7-2022 / TP Claim - Allianz / Survey +

Internal

Your ref: SLX1437Z

Our ref: MKMAISCL2022-00029KC-SJN34388M

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)

File: 2108_001.pdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=561804c9-0ab7-48e5-bd60-7c8eed4baifbd-
b77cb481ceebe069




Size: ~ 0 MByte, Download available until: 7/25/2022

Passwords will be sent in a separate email.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQL | Allianz @) |

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Jess Francis Carlos <jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, July 20, 2022 10:28 AM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] RE: Allianz ref - SIN34388M / Our ref - SLX1437Z M3 / 4-7-2022 / TP Claim - Allianz / Survey +

To whom it may concern,
We would like to follow-up on our request for the TP Claim Survey for this case.
Thank you.

Jess Francis Carlos
Insurance Claims Executive
Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd

5 Ubi Close

Singapore 408605

Tel no.: 8128 9802

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential
and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message
our system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

(® ELROKARS SERVICES




From: Jess Francis Carlos

Sent: 15 July 2022 12:54 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Allianz ref - SIN34388M / Our ref - SLX1437Z M3 / 4-7-2022 / TP Claim - Allianz / Survey +

To whom it may concern,
We would like to follow-up on the request below for the TP Claim Survey to our client’s vehicle.
Thank you.

Jess Francis Carlos
Insurance Claims Executive
Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd

5 Ubi Close

Singapore 408605

Tel no.: 8128 9802

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential
and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message
from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

() ELROKARS SERVICES

From: Jess Francis Carlos

Sent: 12 July 2022 8:01 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Allianz ref - SIN34388M / Our ref - SLX1437Z M3 / 4-7-2022 / TP Claim - Allianz / Survey +

Hi Shanti,
Kindly review the attachment above.
Thank you.

Jess Francis Carlos
Insurance Claims Executive
Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd

5 Ubi Close

Singapore 408605

Tel no.: 8128 9802

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential
and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message
from your system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

5) ELROKARS SERVICES




From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: 12 July 2022 7:24 PM

To: Jess Francis Carlos <jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Allianz ref - SIN34388M / Our ref - SLX1437Z M3 / 4-7-2022 / TP Claim - Allianz / Survey +

Internal
Dear Sir/ Madam,
Kindly provide us a copy of the LTA Search
Thank you.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at
claims@allianz.com.sg

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQP | Altianz @) | (.~

Warldwide Olymplc ond Perolymplc Postner

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail

From: Jess Francis Carlos <jess.carlos@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, July 12, 2022 2:45 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Eric Paul Glorioso <eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Stephanie Loke <stephanie.loke@eurokars.com.sg>; Randell
Goon <randell.goon@eurokars.com.sg>; Derek Oh <derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg>; Jason Wong
<jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Tan Wei Cin <weicin.tan@eurokars.com.sg>; Falcoe Lee
<falcoe.lee.wf@eurokars.com.sg>; James Ng <james.ng.wk@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] Allianz ref - SIN34388M / Our ref - SLX1437Z M3 / 4-7-2022 / TP Claim - Allianz / Survey +

To whom it may concern,

Kindly arrange the TP Claim Survey to our client’s vehicle.

Survey Type SURVEY

(New Survey / Resurvey)




Vehicle to be surveyed : SLX1437Z M3

AIG Insured Vehicle : SJN4388M

Date of Accident : Monday, 4 July 2022
Date of Survey : TBA

Name of Workshop : Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd

Address of Survey Location : | 5 UBI CLOSE, Singapore 408605

Name of Contact Person : Jess Carlos

Contact Number : 8128 9802

Any Undercarriage involved :
NO
(please indicate Yes / No)

Thank you.

Jess Francis Carlos
Insurance Claims Executive
Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd

5 Ubi Close

Singapore 408605

Tel no.: 8128 9802

This email, including any attachment, is intended for the sole use of the recipient(s) named above and may contain information that is confidential
and/or proprietary to the Eurokars Group. If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message
our system. Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.
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