Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, July 20, 2022 4:38 PM

To: MG Solution

Cc: Admin A; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMT760E (PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF - SNC3148G (INDIA) - DOA ON
19/07/2022

Categories: HMK

Dear Ms. Hong / Sharon,
We refer to the above matter.

Please email us your client damages photo and estimated cost of repair once ready.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: MG Solution [mailto:mg3solution@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, July 20, 2022 1:45 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SMT760E (PRE-INSPECTION) ; YOUR REF - SNC3148G (INDIA) - DOA ON 19/07/2022

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please refer to the attached file and arrange pre-inspection. (CAR NOT IN)

We would like to check if a report has been made by your insured. If yes, kindly let us have a copy of your
insured statement. LTA Search & video footage for your reference.

Best Regards,
Ms Hong

MG SOLUTION PTE LTD



No 23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
AAS Kaki Bukit Centre
#04-01 Singapore 415933

Tel: 6243 1373 | Fax: 6243 1376



