Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: KweeRu Lau <Kweeru@yongsingmotor.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 August 2022 11:22 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalise for GBB4363S

Hi Taufikh,

We accept COR at $1,600, 5days.
Thank you.

Regards,

Lau Kwee Ru (Ms)

Fax: 6284 2798
No: 53, Defu Lane 12 Singapore 539144 (Head Office)
No: 10, Defu Lane 8 Singapore 539315
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From: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 August 2022 10:39 am
To: 'KweeRu Lau'

Cc: 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: Finalise for GBB4363S

Hi,
Please refer attached, COR I/s $1600 , 5 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: KweeRu Lau [mailto:Kweeru@yongsingmotor.com]
Sent: Monday, 15 August 2022 1:09 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Finalise for GBB4363S

Hi Taufikh,

Could you offer bit higher? Is $1600 ok?
Thank you.

Regards,

Lau Kwee Ru (Ms)

Fax: 6284 2798
No: 53, Defu Lane 12 Singapore 539144 (Head Office)
No: 10, Defu Lane 8 Singapore 539315
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From: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 15 August 2022 11:53 am
To: 'KweeRu Lau'

Cc: 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: Finalise for GBB4363S

Hi,
Please refer attached, COR I/s $1500, 5 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: KweeRu Lau [mailto:Kweeru@yongsingmotor.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 26 July 2022 5:34 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com

Cc: YONGSINGMOTORS@GMAIL.COM; Zhi Yang Phua
Subject: Finalise for GBB4363S

Dear Taufikh,

Our COR for the above mentioned vehicle is $2,034.60 excluding GST.
Lump Sum repair job and 5 repair days were given.

Please refer to the attachment.

We hope to hear from your confirmation soon.

Thank you.

Regards,

Lau Kwee Ru (Ms)

Fax: 6284 2798
No: 53, Defu Lane 12 Singapore 539144 (Head Office)
No: 10, Defu Lane 8 Singapore 539315
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