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Rajes

From: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 20 July 2022 4:22 PM
To: 'Pauline Tham'; 'Claims Dept of CTI'; 'Chee So Chow'; sur@lkkauto.com; 'assignments'
Subject: RE: 3rd PARTY CLAIMS AGAINST YOUR INSURED VEHICLE SDM7878Y (Our reference : 

INS00138 - our vehicle no. GBB4363S)

Dear Pauline, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Repairer arrange on 21.7.22. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 20 July 2022 3:58 PM 
To: Yong Sing <yongsingmotors@gmail.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow 
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; sur@lkkauto.com; Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' 
<assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: KweeRu Lau <kweeru@yongsingmotor.com>; Zhi Yang Phua <zhiyangphua@yongsingmotor.com> 
Subject: RE: 3rd PARTY CLAIMS AGAINST YOUR INSURED VEHICLE SDM7878Y (Our reference : INS00138 - our vehicle no. 
GBB4363S) 
Importance: High 
 
 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Hi Sam 
 
Thanks for your call to us. 
 
 
Hi LKK 
 
Please take note to conduct PRS asap.  
 
 
** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us. 
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Thanks. 
 
Pauline Tham 
Claims Department 
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6541   |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
   

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please 
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 

From: Yong Sing <yongsingmotors@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, July 18, 2022 5:01 PM 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: KweeRu Lau <kweeru@yongsingmotor.com>; Zhi Yang Phua <zhiyangphua@yongsingmotor.com> 
Subject: 3rd PARTY CLAIMS AGAINST YOUR INSURED VEHICLE SDM7878Y (Our reference : INS00138 - our vehicle no. 
GBB4363S) 
 

 

Attention Motor Claims Department. 
 
Your Ref: SDM7878Y 
 
Our Ref: INS00138  
 
DOA: 11/07/2022 14:50 (SGT) 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm  
 
RE: 3rd PARTY CLAIMS AGAINST YOUR INSURED VEHICLE SDM7878Y  
 
 
Kindly refer to the attachment for our client's SAS report and our estimated cost of repair (based on our visual 
inspection only) for our client's vehicle GBB4363S. 
 
We would like to check on the liability and appreciate it if you could confirm your agreement on a direct 
settlement with us for COR and claim for LOU @ or rental @ . Number of days will be in accordance with your 
surveyor's recommendation. 
 
Please provide a list of surveyors to choose from and you may then arrange to survey our client's vehicle at 
No. 53 Defu Lane 12, Singapore 539144. 
 
We thank you in advance for your assistance in this matter. 
 
 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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With Regards, 
Sam Sim (Mr) 
 
Mobile: 9182 0027 Fax: 6284 2798 
No: 53, Defu Lane 12 Singapore 539144 

 


