Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 August 2022 11:13 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); SUR; Hua Meng

Cc: CS ATeam

Subject: RE: Finalize | SLD2580R  D.O.A: 16.07.2022  TP-MSIG

Dear Jing Yee,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Please submit LOD to MSIG.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 20 August 2022 7:45 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hua Meng <huameng®@live.com.sg>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: Finalize | SLD2580R D.0.A: 16.07.2022 TP-MSIG

Hi Veron,

Please assist. CS/MSG22006876/AGvy3

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: -

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hua Meng <huameng®@live.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 August 2022 11:12 am

To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Finalize | SLD2580R D.0.A: 16.07.2022 TP-MSIG

Dear Officer in Charge

We refer to the telecommunication with your surveyor, Mr Adrian Ling on 16/08/2022 about 1430hours.
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We confirm Cost of repair at lump sum $4,500.00 and 05 repair days.
Please revert confirmation.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jing Yee

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6,

BLK C #01-34/#01-61

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6746 5519

Fax: 6743 4896



