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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, July 20, 2022 11:02 AM
To: 'Ramasamy, Shanti (Allianz Insurance Singapore)'; Admin A
Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: NEW TP DS claim:   SND6878H / GBJ3555U Date of accident:17-07-2022

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Ramasamy, Shanti (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <shanti.ramasamy@allianz.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 July 2022 8:09 PM 
To: admin-a@lkkauto.com; admin-d@lkkauto.com 
Subject: FW: NEW TP DS claim: SND6878H / GBJ3555U Date of accident:17-07-2022 
 

Internal 

 
PW: Allianz1 
 
OI – NON REPORTING - ATLAS TRANSPORT & LOGISTICS PTE. LTD. 
 
allinkins@allink.com.sg – AGENT -  +6565674722, +6582689205, +6598808826 
 
Thank you.  
  
Best regards, 
  

  
   Shanti. R 
   Claims Service  
   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 
   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 
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    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /   
    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  
    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.    
    Thank you. 
  
 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

 
 

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore)  
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 8:06 PM 
To: 'alan.quek@cyclecarriage.com.sg' <alan.quek@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Cc: 'admin-a@lkkauto.com' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'admin-d@lkkauto.com' <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: NEW TP DS claim: SND6878H / GBJ3555U Date of accident:17-07-2022 
 
 Your ref:   SND6878H 
Our ref: 2022 22005694FR-GBJ3555U  
  
Dear Sirs,  
  
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK  to conduct survey. 
  
Kindly engage with them and to arrange for survey.  
  
Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey) 

 File: img-718164218-0001.pdf, CI.pdf, SND6878H.PDF 

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=d0bd0bf1-5f6c-4414-b867-ddcdf2769068-
f8cab4cd42ba8519 

Size: ~ 1 MByte, Download available until: 7/24/2022 
 
Passwords will be sent in a separate email. 

  
  
Thank you.  
  
Best regards, 
  

  
   Shanti. R 
   Claims Service  
   Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C 
   79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897 
   Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg 
  
    

 
  
  
    This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /   
    or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of  
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    this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.    
    Thank you. 
  
 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

 
 

From: Alan Quek <alan.quek@cyclecarriage.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 4:58 PM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; 'Rasul (LKKAuto)' 
<Rasul@lkkauto.com>; stevechen@lkkauto.com; Bryan Ang (bryanang@lkkauto.com) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; 
Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 
<veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [EXT] RE: SND6878H / GBJ3555U Date of accident:17-07-2022 
 
Dear Officer, 
 
 
We agree to use LKK only, thank you. 
 
 
 
Your Sincerely 
 
Alan Quek 
Service Advisor 
Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center 
Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd  
188 Pandan Loop Service Center  
Tel: 6771 4377 | DID: 9186 5112 | Fax: 6872 1272 
Website: www.mercedes-benz.com.sg 
 

     

 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
 
 
From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) [mailto:claims@allianz.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 July 2022 4:23 PM 
To: Alan Quek <alan.quek@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SND6878H / GBJ3555U Date of accident:17-07-2022 
 

This email was sent from outside of your organisation  

Internal 

 
Your ref:   SND6878H 
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Our ref: 2022 22005694FR-GBJ3555U 
  

  

Dear Sirs  

  

Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):- 

  

LKK  
 AJAX  
 FORM TEAM  
 A-PAC 
  

  

  

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list. 

  

  

Best regards, 
  
Shanti.R 
Claims Service 
Claims & Performance Management 
  
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C  
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897  
Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg 
  
   

 
  
Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential 

and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this 

communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

  
Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

 
 

From: Alan Quek <alan.quek@cyclecarriage.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 11:21 AM 
To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Subject: [EXT] SND6878H / GBJ3555U Date of accident:17-07-2022 
 
ALLIANZ INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTE 
Attn: Motor Claims Dept 
 
RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos. SND 6878 H & GBJ 3555 U. 
Along BLK217 SERANGOON AVE 4 CAR PARK. 
 
We have instructs by our client’s of motor vehicle no:SND 6878 H, which was involved in the 
above accident. Our client’s vehicle was damaged and we now claiming against you for costs of 
repair and other consequential loss. 
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In order that you are the insurer of vehicle no:GBJ 3555 U are willing to DIRECT SETTLEMENT 
and other incidental claims. We shall be grateful if you could kindly settle the cost of repair 
directly with us. On this note we will be much appreciated and looking forward to your 
Confirmation of settlement. 
 
 
Your Sincerely 
 
Alan Quek 
Service Advisor 
Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center 
Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd  
188 Pandan Loop Service Center  
Tel: 6771 4377 | DID: 9186 5112 | Fax: 6872 1272 
Website: www.mercedes-benz.com.sg 
 

     
 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 
 
 
 
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity 
named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that 
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are 
those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its 
related corporations.  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity 
named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that 
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are 
those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its 
related corporations.  


