Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 3:49 PM

To: xinhuaworkshop1@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Admin-B

Subject: NEW TP DS claim: - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMY2534C & SMZ 174R AT 472 FERNVALE

ST CAR PARK ON 13.07.2022/2230

Categories: HMK

Internal

Your ref: SMY2534C
Our ref: 2022 22005597FR-SMZ174R

Dear Allan
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey)

File: SMZ174R OI GA. pdf, SMY2534C TP GIA. pdf

Link: https://filexchange. allianz. de/SecureDownload. aspx?id=9f0dddd8-c961-44a9-ae2a-8292a6e4bbc0—
7£3d08fe31¢3955d

Size: ~ 1 MByte, Download available until: 7/26/2022

Passwords will be sent in a separate email.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQL | Altianz @ | (.
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This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.
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&2 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, July 18, 2022 4:02 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshop@gmail.com>

Subject: [EXT] Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMY2534C & SMZ 174R AT 472 FERNVALE ST CAR PARK ON 13.07.2022/2230

Dear Allianz Team.

It has been more than 48hrs , any further delay and the additional rental cost will be incur by Allianz .

Please provide list of surveyors to conduct the pre repair inspection.

Regards,

Allan

87867171

On Thu, 14 Jul 2022 at 16:29, Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshopl@gmail.com> wrote:

To the officer in charge,



We are appointed workshop bearing the car plates SMY2534C ,accident happened due to the collision by your insured SMZ174R

Kindly help to arrange for PRI at the following address:

XINHUA WORKSHOP PTE LTD
No 23 Kaki Bukit ave 4
#04-01

S(415933)

Kindly provide list of surveyors to conduct the pre repair inspection.

Regards,

ALLAN

87867171

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4
#04-01

S(415933)
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