Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 July 2022 8:37 PM

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FINAL BILL for SLM2527Z

Attachments: SLM2527Z.pdf; SLM 2527 main estimate.pdf
Hi Michelle,

Finalize amount correct. Please proceed.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 July 2022 11:21 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FINAL BILL for SLM2527Z

Dear Steve,
Please refer to Final Bill as attached.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

_V_ 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 9129 4556 F (65) 6264 7137
WEARNES  yww.wearnes.com michelle.ong @wearnes.com
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