Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Bin Rosli, Muhammad Faiz (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <muhammad-faiz.bin-
rosli@allianz.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 July 2022 6:21 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Request for Ol GIA report & video - GBC6282Z | SVRAISCL2022-00036

Internal
Dear Cecilia

As damages indicates that it is a head to rear accident, please proceed to reject and close the case.
We noted that survey was done, as such you may submit to us your WP survey report.

Thank you.

Regards,

Allianz @)

Faiz Rosli
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

QQO | Altianz @) | (.~

Warldwide Olympic ond Perolymplc Portner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 27, 2022 5:40 PM

To: Bin Rosli, Muhammad Faiz (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <muhammad-faiz.bin-rosli@allianz.sg>
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [EXT] RE: Request for Ol GIA report & video - GBC6282Z | SVRAISCL2022-00036

Hi Faiz,

We have try to obtain the video footage and police report from TP.



However, TP only able to provide us with poilice report and also inform that the police side told them that they are
unable to release the footage to them and to get the insurance firm to request the footage from the police.

As such, kindly let us have your instruction / approval to proceed with rejection to close the case.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-4274 | HP: 8891 1278 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

FEZES

RERER WWTT Suve the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: Bin Rosli, Muhammad Faiz (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <muhammad-faiz.bin-rosli@allianz.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 21 July 2022 6:19 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for Ol GIA report & video - GBC6282Z | SVRAISCL2022-00036

Internal
Hi Mei Kwan
This is a head to rear case. We view that TP should bear full liability.
Kindly withdraw survey.
Thank you.

Regards,

Allianz ()

Faiz Rosli
Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

QQP | Altianz @) | (.~

Warldwide Olymplc ond Perolymplc Postner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged
information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the
sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

& Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.



Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 July 2022 9:24 am

To: Alvin Tey; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: NEW TP DS claim: ACC INV GBC6282Z AND PC494C ON 12.07.2022 *** LKK REF:
CC4/AIS22006804/Rga3

Without Prejudice
Hi Alvin,

Based on the damages indicated that it is a head to rear accident and that your client has rear ended our insured
vehicle.

In view of above, we have our principal approval to deny the claim and not able to look into this matter.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-4274 | HP: 8891 1278 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS —
Semmmm e Save the FLarthe Print only when necessary:

From: Alvin Tey <alvin.lexbuildauto@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 July 2022 1:34 pm

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: NEW TP DS claim: ACC INV GBC6282Z AND PC494C ON 12.07.2022 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS22006804/Rga3

Dear Mei Kwan,

Kindly refer to that attached police report for your reference.

Thank You.

Regards,



