Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 18 July 2022 4:56 PM

To: Yan (LKK Auto); sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Julie Mangubat; Claims

Subject: Revised : TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10016407 /JT || OI-SJT8437Y (BROWN) TP-SLN2193Y
|| Est: $0.00 || Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Attachments: SLN2193Y DOA 16072022.pdf

Dear all,

Apologies for the confusion.
Revised subject heading.
Attached TP’s GIA report.

Ol yet to report the accident.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Shafawati Md Rabu
Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3697
F +65 6725 0853
E shafawati.m@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Yan (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 18 July 2022 3:56 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@I|kkauto.com

Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Julie Mangubat
<julie.m@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10016339 /JM | | OI-SJT8437Y (BROWN) TP-SHC1189Y || Est: $0.00 | | Pegasus
Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Dear Shafawati,
According to the repairer TP vehicle number is SLN 2193Y.

Kindly advise. Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 18 July 2022 3:31 PM

To: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; sur@Ikkauto.com; assignments@Ikkauto.com

Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Julie Mangubat
<julie.m@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10016339 /IM || OI-SJT8437Y (BROWN) TP-SHC1189Y || Est: $0.00 | | Pegasus
Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Dear Team,
TPPD Survey for TP vehicle : SHC1189Y

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Contact: 6513 7748 / Ng Teng Hua

Attached GIA report and estimate.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Shafawati Md Rabu
Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3697



F +65 6725 0853
E shafawati.m@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Teng Hua <tenghua.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 18 July 2022 11:41 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Eric Hii <eric.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Julie Mangubat
<julie.m@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 16/07/2022 | | Arrangement for Pre-Repair Survey-Peg Ref: VSR22-17859 ; Budget Direct
Ref : C10016339 ; Accident Involving SLN2193Y (GRAB) AND SJT8437Y (BUDGET DIRECT) ON 16/07/2022

Without Prejudice.
Hi Shafawati,

Thank you for your email. We select LKK to conduct the PRS.

Regards,

Ng Teng Hua

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
|
Tel : 6513 7748 | Fax: 6251 3161

Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Make Life a Beautiful Ride

From: Teng Hua <tenghua.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, 16 July 2022 11:49 AM




To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>; Eric Hii <eric.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Subject: Arrangement for Pre-Repair Survey-Peg Ref: VSR22-17859 ; Budget Direct Ref : TBA ; Accident Involving
SLN2193Y (GRAB) AND SJT8437Y (BUDGET DIRECT) ON 16/07/2022

Without Prejudice

Save As To Costs

Dear Motor Claim Department,

We refer to the above matter.

Pursuant to paragraph 2.3 of Pre-Action Protocol for NIMA Cases, please let us have a list of

10 motor surveyors for our selection and please let us know within 2 working days whether you would like
to conduct a pre-repair survey of our client’s vehicle. If we do not hear from you within the stipulated timeline,
our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

In the event that you request for post-repair inspection pursuant to paragraph 4.1 and 7.4 under the NIMA
Protocol, you must compensate our client for the loss of use of his/her vehicle for the day that the inspection
is conducted.

As such, please do the needful.

Please contact us to confirm the date and time of the survey.

In addition, please confirm in writing whether Budget Direct is agreeable to direct settle with us at 100%
liability for this case.

We will forward our client's GIA report as well as our estimated cost of repair to you in due course.

We await your urgent response in this matter.



Regards,
Ng Teng Hua

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748 | Fax : 6251 3161
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Make Life a Beautiful Ride

Virus-free. www.avast.com




